
By Adam Swift

On Jan. 9, the City 
Council will select a new 
council president.

Outgoing President 
Gerry Visconti said there 
is some speculation out 
in the city about who will 
jump in the race, but said 
he didn’t want to comment 
on it until the actual vote 
takes place.

However the vote goes, 
Visconti said he doesn’t 
expect any issues.

“I expect it to be a 
smooth transition, but 
then again, it is Revere,” 
he said.

Visconti said he is more 
than ready to assist with 
the transition for the new 

president and vice presi-
dent for 2023.

Ward 6 Councillor 
Richard Serino is the cur-
rent vice president. Serino 
has announced that he will 
not be seeking reelection 
in November, but he still 
has a full year remaining 
to serve on the council.

Visconti said he en-
joyed his time as council 
president, even with the 
ups and downs of the past 
year.

“Being my first time, it 
was very interesting, and 
as council president, you 

By Journal Staff

The Revere Zoning 
Board of Appeals held 
its regular monthly meet-
ing last Wednesday in 
the City Councillor Joseph 
A. DelGrosso City Coun-
cil Chamber. Chairman 
Robert Tucker and fellow 
members Aklog Lime-
neh, John Lopes, Arthur 
Pelton, and James O'Brien 
were on hand for the meet-
ing.

The first matter 
the board took up was an 
application by Evergreen 
Property Solutions, LLC, 
80 Piers Park Lane, Bos-

ton, requesting a variance 
of RRO Section 17.28.020, 
minimum parking require-
ments, to enable Ever-
green to convert the exist-
ing single-family dwelling 
to a two-family dwelling 
on Lots 433 and 434 at 57 
Stevens Street

Evergreen was seeking 
the variance because four 
parking spots are required 
for a two-family property, 
but it's proposal called for 
only three spaces.

The matter had been 
continued from the board's 
November meeting. A 
number of neighbors had 
spoken against granting 

the variance at that time 
because they objected to 
the additional parking -- a 
two-family home requires 
four parking spaces per the 
ordinance -- being placed 
in the rear of the building. 

Evergreen returned 
in December with a re-
vised plan, eliminating 
the rear-yard parking, but 
only providing for three 
parking spaces, one short 
of the four that are need-
ed. Atty. Joseph Catoggio 
represented the applicant. 
He outlined for the board 
that there already are two 
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RHS CLASS OF 
1972 MAKES 
DONATION

The RHS Class of 1972 
50th Reunion Committee 
is pleased to announce 
that a donation from our 
class of $800 has been 
made to the Revere Com-
munity Scholarship Fund. 
Thanks to all who attend-
ed to make it a fun and 
memorable event

STATE OFFERS 
ENERGY TPS

With the increase in 
winter energy costs, what 
are some quick and afford-
able changes one can do to 
lower my energy use?

Some energy-saving 
options that you can do 
yourself at home include:

• Checking and chang-
ing the air filter in your 
furnace on a monthly ba-
sis. Unclean filters slow 
down airflow and make 
the system work harder, 
thereby wasting energy.

• Adjusting your ther-
mostat just a few degrees 
can make a big difference 
in your bill. When home, 
set your thermostat at 68 
degrees Fahrenheit or 
lower for heating. Low-
er the thermostat 7 to 10 
degrees Fahrenheit each 
time you leave the house 

See ZBA Page 7
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Revere Chamber of 
Commerce launches 
‘Academy’ Program 
for small businesses

ZBA turns down request for parking 
variance to allow for two-family home

See COUNCIL Page 3

Toni Esposito, Carol Tye, Carol Haney, and Kathleen Heiser enjoying brunch and eggnogs 
with branch at Mission Beach House. See more photos on Page 8.

Ice sculptures at Revere Beach Station, sponsored by Next Stop Revere.

A WINTER WONDERLAND AT REVERE BEACH 
FOR NEW YEARS

See NEWS BRIEFS Page 2

By Cary Shuman

Amanda Schepici-Por-
tillo accomplished a lot 
in her first year as execu-
tive director of the Revere 
Chamber of Commerce. 
She recruited several new 
members in the business 
community and is build-
ing upon that resurgence 
as the year 2023 begins.

Schepici Portillo’s 
awards gala in November 
was such a smashing, sold-
out success that guests are 
already inquiring about 
this year’s gala.

She has added new 
initiatives for members, 
starting with this month’s 
launch of the “Revere 
Chamber Academy,” 
which will consist of 
training programs “to help 
people improve their busi-
ness or start a business.”

The first RCA program, 
“Improve Your Social 
Media Marketing Skills,” 
is scheduled for Tuesday, 
Jan. 17 at 11 a.m. Schepi-
ci-Portillo will lead the 
online presentation. Also 
scheduled is a program on 
“How To Retain and At-
tract Great Employees,” to 
be held Thursday, Jan. 26 
at 6:30 p.m. at the Cham-
ber’s office located at 313 
Broadway.

On Feb. 3 at 9:30 a.m., 
the Chamber will hold a 
“W-9 Day,” at which time 
small business owners can 
fill out a W-9 form so they 
are eligible to be a vendor 
for the city.

Networking events 
return in February
Schepici-Portillo be-

came executive director 
of the Chamber of Com-
merce in September, 2021. 
One of her first goals was 
to increase the organiza-
tion’s membership, and it 
has grown to 70 members.  

The Chamber held a se-

ries of networking events 
in Schepici-Portillo’s first 
year, and those will con-
tinue on an every-oth-
er-month basis this year. 
The first networking event 
of 2023 will be held Feb. 
8 at 6:30 p.m. at Mission 
Beach House.

New board  
members added

Patrick Lospennato, 
whose leadership as pres-
ident of the board of direc-
tors has been exemplary, 
will continue to serve in 
that position. The board 
has welcomed two new 
members, Danna Jimenez, 
a loan office at Prime-
Lending, and Amanda 
Bonasoro, owner of Bono 
Appetit Meal Prep.

“We’re getting off to 
a busy start in the new 
year,” said Schepici-Por-
tillo. “We’re looking for-
ward to an exciting year 
ahead. We encourage 
businesses to look at our 
web site for information 
about registration for our 
Training Academy and 
our networking events.”

Amanda Schepici-Portillo 
has begun her second year 
as the executive director 
of the Revere Chamber of 
Commerce.

Council presidency for 2023 
on docket for Jan. 9 meeting

Current leader of the City 
Council, Gerry Visconti. The 
position of Council President 
will be voted on in the first 
meeting of the New Year.

Leave your tree 
out on your 

trash day
between 

Jan 2-Jan 13Jan 2-Jan 13

Put your Christmas 
Trees out to the Curb!

NO YARD WASTE ALLOWEDNO YARD WASTE ALLOWED
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for two or more hours, and 
then again when you go to 
sleep at night.

• In the winter, open 
window dressings during 
the day to capture warmth 
and close them at night to 
prevent heat loss.

• Keep your fireplace 
damper closed unless a 
fire is burning. Keeping 
the damper open is like 
keeping a window wide 
open during the winter – it 
allows warm air to escape 
right up the chimney.

• Switch to ENER-
GY STAR® certified 
light-emitting diode 
(LED) bulbs. LEDs use up 
to 90 percent less energy 
than incandescent bulbs 
and last up to 25 times 
longer.

• How can the Sponsors 
of Mass Save help one 
with financial or billing 
assistance?

The Sponsors of 
Mass Save offer two in-
come-based offerings the 
Enhanced Residential In-

centives and the Income 
Eligible Program. Both 
start with a no-cost Home 
Energy Assessment and 
offer discounted or no-cost 
products and services. You 
can use this table to deter-
mine if you qualify for ei-
ther of these offerings. In-
formation about State and 
Federally funded payment 
assistance programs that 
provide relief on winter 
heating bills can be found 
on your utility’s website. 
Local Community Action 
Agencies may also pro-
vide bill assistance and fi-
nancial assistance toward 
home improvements. 
Lastly, you can enroll in a 
budget or balanced billing 
plans, which allows you to 
pay the same amount each 
month for energy. Based 
on an estimate of your 
energy usage for the year, 
your utility will bill you in 
12 equal increments.

• What is a no-cost en-
ergy assessment, and how 
does one qualify?

Whether you’re a home-
owner, renter, landlord, or 
business owner, the Spon-
sors of Mass Save® offer 
no-cost virtual or in-per-
son Energy Assessments. 
This assessment is a great 
way to find energy-saving 
opportunities within your 
home or business. An En-
ergy Specialist will assess 
your current energy use, 
help you develop a plan 
to make your home or 
business more energy ef-
ficient, as well as educate 
you on available rebates 
and incentives.

• What kind of help can 
one expect to receive from 
the Sponsors of Mass 
Save?

On top of no-cost as-
sessments and financial 
assistance programs, the 

Sponsors of Mass Save 
also offer a range of rebate 
options and incentives. To 
see available rebate op-
tions for both your home 
or business, follow the 
links or visit www.mass-
save.com

• Where do one go to 
get energy efficient prod-
ucts? (Mass Save Market-
place)

To find and purchase 
affordable energy efficient 
products, use the Mass 
Save Marketplace. Access 
sales through the residen-
tial or commercial mar-
ketplaces for items such 
as electronics, appliances, 
and other equipment, val-
id through 12/31/22.

 
ESTADO OFRECE 
CONSEJOS 
ENERGÉTICOS 

• Con el aumento en los 
costos de energía durante 
el invierno, ¿cuáles son al-
gunos cambios?

Algunas opciones de 
ahorro de energía que 
puede hacer usted en casa 
incluyen:

• Revisar y cambiar el 
filtro de aire de su horno 
mensualmente. Los filtros 
sucios bloquean y reducen 
el flujo de aire, haciendo 
que el sistema trabaje más 
y desperdicie energía.

• Ajustar su termosta-
to solo unos pocos gra-
dos puede hacer una gran 
diferencia en su factu-
ra. Cuando esté en casa, 
configure su termostato 
a 68 grados Fahrenheit o 
menos para la calefacción. 
Baje el termostato de 7 a 
10 grados Fahrenheit cada 
vez que salga de la casa 
por dos horas o más, y de 
nuevo cuando se vaya a 
dormir por la noche.

• En invierno, abra las 

cortinas/persianas durante 
el día para captar el calor y 
ciérrelas por la noche para 
evitar la pérdida de calor.

• Mantenga cerrada la 
compuerta de la chime-
nea a menos de que haya 
fuego. Mantener la com-
puerta abierta es como 
mantener una ventana 
completamente abierta 
durante el invierno: per-
mite que el aire caliente 
escape por la chimenea.

• Cambie a bombillas 
de diodo emisor de luz 
(LED por sus siglas en 
inglés) certificadas por 
ENERGY STAR®. Los 
LED usan hasta un 90 por 
ciento menos de energía 
que las bombillas incan-
descentes y duran hasta 25 
veces más.

 
• ¿Cómo pueden 

ayudarme los patroci-
nadores de Mass Save con 
asistencia financiera o de 
facturación?

Los patrocinadores de 
Mass Save® ofrecen dos 
ofertas con base en los 
ingresos: los Incentivos 
Residenciales Mejorados 
y el Programa Elegible 
Según los Ingresos. Am-
bos comienzan con una 
evaluación de energía del 
hogar sin costo y ofrecen 
productos y servicios con 
descuento o sin costo. 
Puede usar esta gráfica 
para determinar si califica 
para cualquiera de estas 
ofertas. Puede encontrar 
información sobre los pro-
gramas de asistencia de 
pago financiados por el 
estado y el gobierno fed-
eral que brindan alivio en 
las facturas de calefacción 
de invierno en el sitio web 
de su empresa de servicios 
públicos. Las Agencias de 
Acción Comunitaria Local 
también pueden brindar 
asistencia con las factur-
as y asistencia financiera 
para realizar mejoras en el 
hogar. Por último, puede 
inscribirse en un plan de 
presupuesto o facturación 
balanceada, que le permite 

pagar la misma cantidad 
cada mes por energía. 
Según una estimación de 
su uso de energía para el 
año, su empresa de servi-
cios públicos le facturará 
en 12 incrementos iguales.

• ¿Qué es una evalu-
ación de energía sin costo 
y cómo califico?

Ya sea propietario de 
una vivienda, inquilino, 
arrendador o dueño de 
un negocio, los patroci-
nadores de Mass Save® 
ofrecen evaluaciones de 
energía virtuales o en per-
sona sin costo. Esta evalu-
ación es una excelente 
manera de encontrar opor-
tunidades de ahorro de 
energía dentro de su hogar 
o negocio. Un especial-
ista en energía evaluará 
su uso actual de energía, 
lo ayudará a desarrollar 
un plan para hacer que su 
hogar o negocio sea más 
eficiente energéticamente 
y lo educará sobre los re-
embolsos e incentivos di-
sponibles.

• ¿Qué tipo de ayu-
da puedo esperar recibir 
de los patrocinadores de 
Mass Save?

Además de evalua-
ciones sin costo y pro-
gramas de asistencia finan-
ciera, los patrocinadores 
de Mass Save® también 
ofrecen una variedad de 
opciones de reembolso e 
incentivos. Para ver las 
opciones de reembolso di-
sponibles para su hogar o 
negocio, siga los enlaces o 
visite www.masssave.com

• ¿Dónde debo ir para 
obtener productos en-
ergéticamente eficientes? 
(Mass Save Marketplace)

Para encontrar y com-
prar productos económi-
cos de bajo consumo, 
utilice Mass Save Market-
place. Acceda a las ventas 
a través de los mercados 
residenciales o comercia-
les de artículos como elec-
trónicos, electrodomésti-
cos y otros equipos, 
válidos hasta el 31/12/22.

News Briefs //  CONTI NUED FROM PAGE 1

Council //  CONTINUED FROM PAGE 1

SPOTLIGHT
The new year at RevereTV begins with a handful of 

new cooking shows! If you tune in to the Community 
Channel, you will see episodes of “What’s Cooking, 
Revere?” and “Fabulous Foods with Victoria Fabbo” 

playing all week. Victoria Fabbo is a local dietician and 
chef who began her TV journey at RTV being featured 
on “What’s Cooking, Revere?” She had been recording 

so many episodes in the kitchen studio that she now has 
her own program. In Fabbo’s latest episodes, you can 

follow along as she makes beef stew, beef braciole with 
vegetables, and  creates her own twist on lasagna. For 

the latest on “What’s Cooking, Revere?,” the recipes are 
led by community member Diana Cardona and another 

by the owners of Valsos Table and Bar. You can find all of 
RevereTV’s cooking programs posted to YouTube to be 

viewed at any time.

Last Sunday, the Community Channel was stacked with 
some top programs and fun event coverage from 2022. 
These programs included sports coverage, community 

event coverage, educational forums, and popular 
cooking shows. This schedule was put together as a 

highlight reel of the past year to celebrate as we move 
on to 2023. For another chance to commemorate 2022 

with RevereTV, the schedule will repeat this Sunday. 
Tune in to channel 8/1072 on Comcast and 3/614 on 

RCN to watch.

The Game of the Week this week is RHS Girls Basketball 
vs. Medford tomorrow at 6pm. Watch it live on the 
Community Channel, Facebook, and YouTube. Last 

week’s game was RHS Girls Basketball vs. Milton and it 
is now replaying on television. Games posted to social 
media may be taken down until the end of the season, 
but replays will be scheduled on RTV at various times 

over the weeks following each game.

If you are interested in becoming a member at RevereTV, 
call 781-426-9498 to schedule an appointment to tour 
the studio and learn more about what RTV can offer. 
Memberships are free to any resident of Revere. As a 

member, you will be able to take classes on production 
and editing that can lead you into being an independent 
producer of your own show. Some community members 

join to take on a volunteer role on community shoots. 
RevereTV hopes to continue to be your community 
source through 2023, and thanks all new and old 

community members that help to keep the studio’s 
programming possible. 

GERRY D’AMBROSIO
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get to be involved in so 
much,” he said. “It was an 
interesting year, to say the 
least.”

One large, looming piece 
of business for the council 
in the new year is the Re-
vere High School building 
project and its nearly $500 
million price tag.

With deadlines for 
submittals to the Massa-
chusetts School Building 
Authority looming, at its 
last meeting of 2022,the 
City Council voted to send 
the project, with its near-
ly $500 million estimated 
price tag, to committee for 
further discussion.

According to Brian Da-
kin of Leftfield, the $499 
million worst case scenar-
io budget estimate needed 
to be sent to the MSBA 
in December as part of 
the approval process of 
the schematic design pro-
cess of the project. The 
MSBA would then review 
the project budget and 
timeline over January and 
February before making a 
decision in March which 
would set the state reim-

bursement rate and clear 
the way for the city to put 
the project out for bonding 
for its portion of the cost.

But a number of coun-
cillors balked at having less 
than a week to review a 
half-a-billion dollar project.

Once the new council 
president and vice presi-
dent are selected, Viscon-
ti said the subcommittee 
memberships and leader-
ship will be determined, 
with the high school proj-
ect being sent to the ways 
and means subcommittee.

Visconti said it is like-
ly the review of the high 
school project will be slat-
ed for a meeting within a 
week or two of the Jan. 9 
organizational meeting.

“There is some infor-
mation we need to come 
from the administration 
and the CFO on the cost 
and how this is going to 
be paid for,” said Visconti. 
“We can’t put the cart be-
fore the horse, we need to 
know how this is going to 
be paid for. This is the big-
gest investment the city is 
going to make.”

So you tested posi-
tive for COVID-19, what 
now?

1. Call your doctor!
2. Start isolating.
Please isolate in your 

home for at least 5 full 
days from either your 
symptom start date or the 
date of your positive test.

If you're still feeling 
sick, DO NOT LEAVE 
ISOLATION AFTER 
DAY FIVE. Stay at home.

Your symptoms must be 
gone for 24 hours or more 
to be cleared from isola-
tion.

If possible, start isolat-

ing from people in your 
home: stay in a separate 
room, if possible use a 
different bathroom from 
the rest of your household 
or clean the bathroom 
well after each use. Wear 
a mask if you are around 
other family members, 
and don’t prepare meals 
with your family if possi-
ble.

3. Call your close con-
tacts!

Call anyone who you 
were in close contact with 
for the two days before 
your positive test or two 
days before you started 
developing symptoms. 
Let them know that they 

potentially have been ex-
posed to COVID and need 
to take appropriate steps.

Your close contacts 
may also need to quaran-
tine and should get tested 
about 3-5 days after ex-
posure. Learn more about 
where to get tested in Re-
vere here.

4. If you took an at-
home COVID-19 rapid 
test and got a positive re-
sult, please assume you 
are positive and follow the 
instructions above.

5. The COVID-19 Ho-
tline (617-933-0797) is 
available to the commu-
nities of Cambridge, Re-
vere, Chelsea and Win-

throp. The purpose of this 
hotline is 1) to provide 
COVID-19 guidance to 
people in our commu-
nities, and 2) to provide 
resource coordination 
to residents isolating at 
home away from others so 
that households can meet 
essential needs during the 
isolation period. Resource 
Coordinators are able to 
provide information on 
or referral for food, treat-
ment, financial assistance, 
mask and test access, 
vaccine scheduling, etc. 
Hours of operation are 
M-F, 9-4:30pm, and calls 
are typically returned the 
same day.

Testing Positive for COVID-19 | Steps to take next
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Guest Op-Ed

Those who are grieving and suffering loss
By Dr. Glenn Mollette 

Throughout the years, 
many of us watched Bar-
bara Walters from NBC 
to ABC. I always tried to 
watch her special inter-
views. Often, the people 
she interviewed on prime-
time television specials 
were “the” high profile 
people at that given time. 
She became the highest 
paid journalist of her day 
being the first to sign a 
million-dollar contract 
with ABC. 

Regardless of what 
we do in life we are still 
confronted by difficulties 
that often debilitate us. 
Walters had survived her 
own personal struggles, 
like we all do, including 
four divorces. Unfortu-
nately, her reported battle 
with dementia took its toll 
on her health. We can all 
accomplish much in life. 
Maybe not as much as 
Walters or maybe even 
more. Regardless, there is 
much about life we can’t 
do anything about other 
than try to deal with it and 
do the best we can. 

 At least 37 people died 
from the recent winter 

storm in Buffalo, New 
York. Families are griev-
ing. Hurricanes, torna-
does, floods, freezing 
temperatures, and snow 
have wreaked devastation 
on our country in the last 
twelve months. Loss of 
life can come from dis-
ease, weather, accidents or 
unconscionably by design. 

We all have been hor-
rified by the death of 
four college students 
in Moscow, Idaho. It’s 
been beyond us how four 
beautiful people could be 
stabbed to death in their 
beds reportedly between 
3:00 and 4:00 in the morn-
ing. A young man who is 
a student at nearby Wash-
ington State University on 
the Pullman campus has 
been arrested at his par-
ents’ house in Albrights-
ville, Pennsylvania. Mos-
cow police believe they 
now have the murderer in 
custody. 

How anyone could 
commit such a heinous 
crime is beyond our com-
prehension. I’m sure it 
was beyond the scope of 
thought for these innocent 
young adults. We never 
know who is taking note 

of our lives, whereabouts 
and activities. Regardless 
of how calm and safe your 
community seems you 
can’t take anything for 
granted. Lock your doors. 
Lock your bedroom door. 
Keep your handgun on 
your lampstand and try 
your best to create an envi-
ronment that protects you 
as much as possible. With 
so many people sleeping 
in the rental house in Mos-
cow, I’m sure these young 
college students felt safe. 
What appeared to be safe 
for them became an op-
portunity for an evil mind. 

Typically, the attacker 
has the element of surprise 
on his side. It’s always 
best to try to think ahead. 
Sadly, four Idaho Univer-
sity students were killed 
by someone who planned, 
plotted, and was patient 
enough to find the right 
moment to carry out the 
murders. 

Accepting and deal-
ing with what we cannot 
change is one thing. Pre-
paring for life but rolling 
with the punches, the turns 
and twists is another. Be-
ing watchful, careful, and 
never taking anything for 
granted could make the 
difference between life 
and death

Pray for these families 
and all the many friends 
and loved ones as they 
grieve and suffer from 
such devastating loss. 

Glenn Mollette is the 
publisher of Newburgh 
Press, Liberty Torch and 
various other publishing 
imprints; a national col-
umnist –  American Issues 
and Common Sense opin-
ions, analysis, stories and 
features appear each week 
In over 500 newspapers, 
websites and blogs across 
the United States.
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R e v e r e Forum
WE ARE LIVING -- AND  

DYING -- WITH COVID-19

Although the restrictions -- masking, social distanc-
ing, etc. -- that were imposed during the first two years 
of the COVID-19 pandemic are largely gone and forgot-
ten by the vast majority of Americans, the unfortunate 
reality is that COVID-19 has not forgotten us.

More than 315 Americans still are dying each and ev-
ery day from COVID-19 -- that's about 115,000 deaths 
per year -- making COVID-19 the third leading cause of 
death in the U.S. after heart disease and cancer.

Ordinarily, those huge numbers would be cause for a 
public health emergency. But in comparison to the 3,000 
deaths per day that were occurring during the first two 
years of the pandemic, it seems we've become compla-
cent.

We also would note that beyond the still-shocking 
death toll, COVID-19 continues to wreak havoc with 
our economy, with even the most conservative estimates 
asserting that thanks to time lost from work, hospital-
izations, long-term medical care, and other disruptions, 
COVID-19 continues to cost us more than $500 billion 
per year -- a huge sum attributable to a little bug.

Perhaps one reason why we have become so blase 
about the risks of COVID-19 -- beyond  "pandemic fa-
tigue" -- is that COVID-19 has become a deadly disease 
almost exclusively among our country's senior citizens.

Since the beginning of the pandemic, people 65 
and older accounted for 75 percent of all American 
COVID-19 deaths. That dropped below 60 percent as 
recently as September 2021. But today, Americans 65 
and over account for 90 percent of new COVID-19 
deaths, even though 94 percent of American seniors 
have some level of vaccination.

However, far too many seniors have not received 
the new bivalent booster that became available a few 
months ago. Given that the immune systems of those 
over 65 are weaker to begin with and that the protection 
of the vaccine weakens over time, especially for seniors, 
the failure of senior citizens to get the latest bivalent 
vaccine booster has created a perfect opportunity for 
COVID-19 to infiltrate our senior population.

In our view, there are two takeaways from these sta-
tistics: First, every senior should get the new bivalent 
booster ASAP. Second, those who come into contact 
with seniors, whether in their personal or business lives, 
should wear a mask in order not to spread the disease to 
our most-vulnerable population.

Sorry to say, COVID-19 is not going away anytime 
soon. But two simple steps for our seniors and those 
who care about them -- an updated vaccine and a mask 
-- can go a long way toward mitigating the ongoing hu-
man tragedy of this insidious disease.

PELE, THE ONE AND ONLY

Over the course of the past 60 years, there was one 
person who indisputably was the most famous man on 
the planet -- and that person was Pele.

Even those who knew nothing about soccer -- or any 
other sport -- still recognized his name in all four cor-
ners of the globe.

Pele revolutionized not only the game of soccer with 
his speed, finesse, power, and skill, but also the sports 
world in general. He became the first global superstar 
and elevated athletic competition into the realm of the 
international arena more than any person ever has.

It is because of Pele that more American children -- 
boys and girls -- play soccer today than any other sport 
in our country.

But what truly made Pele great was his incredible 
humility. He became an international star at the age of 
17 when he led Brazil to the first of three World Cups 
in 1958, but throughout his long life, he never forgot 
his roots in the impoverished favela of his hometown of 
Santos, where he learned his soccer skills on the streets.

Pele served as an ambassador both for his country 
and the world of sports for decades, radiating his warm 
smile and joy wherever he went.

Pele was a beautiful man who played the beautiful 
game as no one ever has, both on and off the pitch. He 
will be missed.

Correction re: The License Commission is not the ZBA

In last week's Journal, we published two news articles under the headlines, "ZBA addresses neighbors' complaints at two businesses" 
and "ZBA approves one new license, some changes, and many renewals."  In addition, both articles referred to "The Revere Zoning Board 
of Appeals" in the very first sentence. Those news stories presented accurate descriptions of what transpired at the meeting.

But there was one "minor" problem: The meeting was conducted by the Revere License Commission, not the Zoning Board of Appeals.
We have no real explanation for the snafu, other than that it was holiday time and we were rushing about to meet our deadlines.
Still, it was a screw-up. 
On the other hand, as we often say to the younger members of our staff, "This is not our first mistake, and it won't be our last."
We recall that 30 years or so ago, a headline from our sister newspaper, the Chelsea Record, made it onto Jay Leno's regular comedy 

segment on the Tonight Show when he would highlight newspaper ads, stories, and headlines that had humorous misspellings, etc. Our 
mix-up was that we confused the "spring-forward/fall-back" notice for the change of the clocks for Daylight Savings Time.

It got a lot of laughter from the audience and actually, we were delighted that the Chelsea Record had made it onto Jay Leno's Tonight 
Show. Yes, our moment of fame was unflattering, but we had a good laugh too. (And we never made that mistake again!).

So we all live and learn, as the saying goes, and we will do our best not to confuse the ZBA with the Licensing Commission -- or with 
the Human Rights Commission, the Conservation Commission, the Board of Health, the Housing Trust Fund, or any of the other boards, 
commissions, and committees we cover -- in the future.

For the record, the Zoning Board of Appeals story in this week's Journal is indeed about last week's ZBA meeting -- and yes, we double 
and triple-checked both our headline and story!
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Staff Report

Local banks are helping 
to address one of the most 
difficult challenges facing 
our community: financial 
management.

The Money Manage-
ment Program at Mys-
tic Valley Elder Services 
(MVES) assists older 
adults and people with dis-
abilities with budgeting, 
bill paying and keeping 
track of financial matters. 
MVES recently accepted 
generous donations and 
sponsorships from the fol-

lowing:
• Brookline Bank
• Eagle Bank
• East Cambridge Sav-

ings Bank
• Eastern Bank Charita-

ble Foundation
• EverettBank
• Metro Credit Union
• M&T Bank Foun-

dation/People’s United 
Community Foundation 
of Eastern MA

• Northern Bank & 
Trust Company

• Patriot Community 
Bank

• Salem Five Charitable 

Foundation
• StonehamBank
• The Savings Bank/

TSB Charitable Founda-
tion, Inc.

• Wakefield Co-opera-
tive Bank

• Winchester Savings 
Bank

• Winchester Co-opera-
tive Bank

These banks have al-
ready contributed a com-
bined total of $55,000 this 
year to support the Money 
Management Program.

“Without the support 
of these banks, the Mon-
ey Management Program 
could not accomplish its 
goal of helping people 
stay in the community 
and stay independent,” 
said Lisa Gurgone, MVES 
Chief Executive Officer. 
“We are truly grateful for 
our partners in the busi-
ness community.”

Financial challenges 
are a growing problem for 
older adults. The average 
debt of households aged 
65 and up nearly tripled 
from 1989 to 2016, ac-
cording to a 2021 report 
by the Congressional Re-
search Service. The per-
centage of households 
aged 65 and up that held 
any debt increased from 
37.8% to 61.1% in that 
time. In addition, the re-
port found that in 2019, 
4.9 million people aged 65 

Special to the Journal

Massachusetts State 
Treasurer, Deborah B. 
Goldberg, recently an-
nounced the launch of the 
Treasurer’s Office’s newly 
designed  Small Business 
Resource Toolkit web-
site. The toolkit provides 
access to comprehensive 
resources and materials 
for small business owners 
and future entrepreneurs 
in Massachusetts. 

Under the direction of 
Treasurer Goldberg, the 
toolkit was designed to 
provide a range of rele-
vant, important informa-
tion, often needed, when 
facing the enormous chal-
lenge of starting a small 
business for the first time. 

Typically, it has been im-
possible to easily find the 
resources and advisors 
that can help lead to suc-
cess. This website offers 
valuable educational ma-
terials on how to plan, 
maintain, and grow a suc-
cessful small business.

“By collecting relevant 
resources in one place on-
line, we are providing an 
understandable road map 
for people as they begin 
to develop and open their 
own businesses,” said 
State Treasurer Deborah 
B. Goldberg. “One of my 
top priorities has been to 
ensure that everyone has 
equal access to the tools 
and information they 
need to succeed. And by 
supporting the growth of 

independent small busi-
nesses, we not only pos-
itively impact their own 
development, but also our 
local communities and the 
state’s economy, in many 
positive ways.”

To help ensure that 
small businesses thrive, 
this toolkit provides addi-
tional information about 
banks, community de-
velopment financial in-
stitutions (CDFIs), and 
community partners avail-
able across the Common-
wealth.

“Successful small busi-
nesses are critical gener-
ators of wealth, they are 
the backbone of the econ-
omy,” said State Senator 
Lydia Edwards (D-Bos-
ton). “I am so thankful 

to Treasurer Deborah 
Goldberg and her team 
for creating a website that 
serves as a one-stop-shop 
for small businesses new 
and old. I look forward to 
sharing this new resource 
with my constituents.”

“The State of MA Trea-
surer’s Office has taken 
yet another step to active-
ly support economic em-
powerment for entrepre-
neurs and small businesses 
throughout the Common-
wealth,” said Samilys Ro-
driguez, Director – East-
ern Massachusetts Center 
for Women & Enterprise. 
“The Center for Women 
& Enterprise Women’s 
Business Centers are just 
one of many business re-
sources in the Treasurer’s 

new Small Business Re-
source Toolkit, which can 
provide additional support 
and guidance for clients 
to achieve their next busi-
ness milestones.”

“Congratulations  to the 
Office of the Treasurer's 
team for their hard work 
and dedication in creating 
a website that connects 
and provides resources for 
business owners in Mas-
sachusetts,” said Aliesha 
J. Porcena, City of Bos-
ton Director of Office of 
Economic Opportunity & 
Inclusion. “At the City of 
Boston, we are committed 
to working across agen-
cies, to make sure busi-
ness owners have the re-
sources and tools to start, 
grow, and build a business 

in Boston. As we work to 
address the many hurdles 
that businesses face, and 
build a community of sup-
port for businesses, this 
tool is an effort in that di-
rection.”

There are several orga-
nizations and community 
partners across the state 
that help business owners 
with technical assistance 
and business counsel-
ing.  The Treasurer’s Of-
fice’s website has identi-
fied these organizations 
and placed them by coun-
ty and category on a Small 
Business Resource Map. 
This map will be updated 
on a regular basis.

Celebrate Catholic
Schools Week 2023

  January 29 - February 4
#CSW23

Publishing January 25 & 26
3x5 or 2x8 Color $200.00 Per Paper
3x5 or 2x8 Color $750.00 4 Papers

3x5 or 2x8 Color $1,000.00 8 Papers
The Revere Journal • The Winthrop Sun Transcript • Chelsea Record
Everett Independent • East Boston Times Free Press • Lynn Journal

Charlestown Patriot Bridge • North End Regional Review

Deadline: Thursday, January 19th
Email your rep.  or call 781-485-0588

Deb DiGregorio - deb@reverejournal.com
Maureen DiBella - mdibella@winthroptranscript.com

Sioux Gerow - charlestownads@hotmail.com

This year's theme is “Catholic Schools: Faith. Excellence. Service.” Catholic schools have 
a specific purpose to form students to be good citizens of the world, love God and neighbor 

and enrich society with the leaven of the gospel and by example of faith.
As communities of faith, Catholic schools instill in students their destiny to become saints.  

Academic excellence is the hallmark of Catholic education intentionally directed to the 
growth of the whole person – mind, body and spirit.  Finally, service is fundamental to 

Catholic education and the core of Catholic discipleship.  Service is intended to help form 
people who are not only witnesses to Catholic social teaching, but also active participants 

through social learning.

Why have some communities not 
been a part of health research?
You can help researchers develop new and better 
treatments that benefit all of us.

Many groups of people have been left out of research 
in the past. That means we know less about their health. 
When you join the All of Us Research Program, you’ll 
help researchers learn more about what makes people 
sick or keeps them healthy.

JoinAllofUs.org/NewEngland
(617) 768-8300

 All participants will receive a 
$25 gift card after completion of 
their visit. To complete the visit, 
participants must create an 
account, give consent, agree to 
share their electronic health 

records, decide whether they want information  
about their DNA, answer health surveys, have 
their physical measurements taken (height, 
weight, blood pressure, etc), and give blood 
and urine samples, if asked.

All of Us and the All of Us logo are registered service 
marks of the U.S. Department of Health and Human Services.

Receive
$25*

MAR_AoUNE_MGB_PRINT_ING_Diversity_Newspaper_3.375x5_060922_MC_W615460.indd   1MAR_AoUNE_MGB_PRINT_ING_Diversity_Newspaper_3.375x5_060922_MC_W615460.indd   16/9/22   5:33 PM6/9/22   5:33 PM

• Applicants must be at least 55 years old. 
• Applicants must meet selection criteria. 
• Applicants must income-qualify. (Maximum gross 

income limits for a 1-person household is $56,400 and for a 
2-person household is $64,440 as of 4/21, subject to change).

PROSPECT HOUSE Assisted Living & Memory Care 
has affordable 1BR and studio apartment homes for 
lease immediately under the federal Low Income 
Housing Tax Credit (LIHTC) program! Make the move  
today and enjoy living in our beautiful community!

INCOME LIMITS & GUIDELINES APPLY

Be You,  
Be Vibrant!

State Treasurer’s office launches small business toolkit and resource map

Ready to make a difference? Start at the top! https://careers.ebnhc.org

201420152016201720192020

TOP PLACES TO WORK
EIGHT-TIME AWARDEE

20212022

for helping us win The Boston Globe’s Top Places to Work 
for an eighth time. We are proud to be a team that delivers 

compassionate, high-quality care to our community.

Congratulations to the staff of the
East Boston Neighborhood Health Center

Banks Team with MVES to support financial stability; donations total $55,000
and older lived in poverty.

Since 1990, the Mon-
ey Management Program 
has assisted older adults 
and people with disabilities 
throughout the MVES ser-
vice area. The program’s 
trained and insured volun-
teers help prevent evictions 
and loss of utilities and safe-
guard residents from finan-

cial exploitation and abuse.
“We are grateful that 

providing financial educa-
tion opportunities is a core 
value for these banks,” said 
Larry Poirier, longtime 
Money Management Pro-
gram Manager for MVES. 
“With their generosity, our 
volunteers make an imme-
diate and meaningful im-

pact in the community.”
Please call 781-324-

7705 or email info@mves.
org if you are interested 
in sponsoring the Money 
Management Program, 
becoming a volunteer, or 
know someone who could 
benefit from the program.

Larry Poirier, Money Management Program Manager, and 
Alex Ragusa, Program Associate, assist older adults and 
people with disabilities throughout the MVES service area. 
With support from local banks, said Poirier, MVES volun-
teers “make an immediate and meaningful impact in the 
community.”
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OBITUARIES

To place a 
memoriam in the 
Revere Journal, 

please call 
781-485-0588

Family and friends are 
respectfully invited to at-
tend Visiting Hours on 
Friday, January 6 from 9 
to 11:30 a.m. in Vazza’s 
“Beechwood” Funeral 

Home, 262 Beach St., 
Revere for Gerald T. “Jer-
ry” Sasso who died peace-
fully in the loving pres-
ence of his family at home 
on December 30 follow-
ing a long illness. He just 
celebrated his 80th birth-
day on December 9th. A 
Funeral Mass will be cel-
ebrated in St. Anthony of 
Padua Church, 250 Re-
vere St., Revere at 12 p.m. 
followed by interment in 
Cedar Grove Cemetery, 
Peabody.

Jerry was one of two 
children born to his late 
parents. He was raised 
and educated in Revere 
Schools and graduated 
from Revere High School. 

Jerry knew his calling 
early on, as he became an 
auto mechanic. He always 
had a passion for cars and 
enjoyed working on them. 
His entire working career 
was spent as a mechanic. 
He owned and operated 
Jerry’s Texaco in Revere 
and later Jerry’s Mobil in 
Middleton. He then left 
and worked at several car 
dealerships where he be-
came the service manager. 
He was most remembered 
for being the mechanic for 
the Revere Police Depart-
ment, where he spent the 
later part of his career, for 
over 15 years, before retir-
ing in 2005. 

Jerry married his wife, 
Jean on November 11, 
1963. The couple re-
mained in Revere where 
together they raised a son, 
Jerry and a daughter, Jill. 
He was a hardworking 

man, providing for his 
family. 

In 2012, they left Re-
vere and moved to Pea-
body. Jerry enjoyed fixing 
things around the house, 
working on the cars 
and enjoying time with 
friends. He truly loved 
when he and his wife trav-
eled, especially to Aruba, 
his favorite place to be. 
Jerry also enjoyed smok-
ing his cigars. He will be 
remembered as a loving 
husband and father, a loy-
al friend and a good man.

He is the beloved hus-
band of 59 years of Jean 
R. (DeYeso) Sasso of Pea-
body, formerly of Revere, 
the loving father of Gerald 
P. Sasso of Peabody and 
Jill P. Sasso of Middleton 
and the dear brother of the 
late Joseph J. Sasso. He 
is also lovingly survived 
by his canine pal, “Bud-
dy” and several nieces, 
nephews, grandnieces and 
grandnephews.

 In lieu of flowers, re-
membrances may be made 
to Care Dimensions, 75 
Sylvan St., Danvers, MA 
01923. For online con-
dolences and guest book, 
please visit: www.vazzaf-
unerals.com.

Funeral arrangements 
under the care and direc-
tion of Vazza’s Beech-
wood Funeral Home.

Paul E. Draper, 61, of 
Lynn, formerly of Revere, 
died at Lowell General 
Hospital on Wednesday, 
December 28.

Born in Winthrop, Mr. 
Draper was the son of the 
late Earl F. and Margaret 
L. (Alioto) Draper, Jr. He 
was a hairdresser for 40 
years and was the former 
proprietor of Headquarters 
on Broadway in Revere.

Paul is survived by his 
brother, Earl F. Draper III 
and his wife, Cheryl of 
Canton; his sister, Patricia 
Draper Balley and her hus-
band, Peter of Peabody, 
five nieces and neph-
ews: Christopher Draper, 
Kimberly Dias, Matthew 

Draper, Paige Balley and 
Zachary Balley.

Relatives and friends 
are invited to attend vis-
iting hours in the Bis-
bee-Porcella Funeral 
Home, 549 Lincoln Ave., 
Saugus on Wednesday, 
January 11 from 4 to 8 
p.m. A funeral will be held 
from the funeral home on 
Thursday, January 12 at 
9:45 a.m. followed by a 
Funeral Mass at 11 a.m. 
in St. Anthony of Padua 
Church, 250 Revere St., 
Revere. Interment in will 
be in Woodlawn Cemetery, 
Everett. In lieu of flowers, 
donations in Paul’s mem-
ory may be made to Shri-
ner’s Hospital for Chil-
dren at  shrinerschildrens.
orgFor directions and con-
dolences www.BisbeePor-
cella.com.

A Funeral Service 
was conducted 

on Saturday, 
December 31 
in the Vertuc-

cio & Smith Home for Fu-
nerals for Ret. Revere Fire 
Department Lt. Michael 
Thomas Kippenberger 
who died unexpected-
ly on Friday, December 
23 at the Lowell General 
Hospital. He was 70 years 
old. Interment with Mil-
itary Honors took place 
in Woodlawn Cemetery, 
Everett.

Michael, also known 
as “Kippy” or Mike, was 
born in Chelsea to his late 
parents, Ret. Revere Fire 
Department Capt. Paul 
F. Kippenberger, Sr. and 
Irene T. “Renee” (Tuite) 
Kippenberger. He was the 
middle child of his broth-
er and sister. He grew up 
on Harrington Street in 
Revere, was educated in 
Revere Public Schools 
and was a graduate of Re-
vere High School, Class 
of 1971. 

Following high school, 
Kippy enlisted in the 
United States Navy and 
proudly and faithfully 
served his country. When 
he returned home, he and 
his family moved to Tops-
field. 

Kippy started working 
in construction as well as 
any other way he could 
make a buck. On October 
1, 1976, he married Mary 
Ellen (Haggerty.) 

Kippy followed in his 
father’s footsteps both 
working for him as a lock-
smith at Atlantic Lock of 
Revere, as well as follow-
ing his steps getting sworn 
in at Revere Fire Depart-
ment.

Mike and MaryEllen 
moved to North Street in 
Topsfield in April of 1981, 
after welcoming their only 
son, Michael in December 
of 1980. This new home, 
that he built himself (with 
the help of many) was 
something that made him 
proud. He, his wife and 
his son enjoyed many 
happy memories on North 
Street. 	

While on the fire de-
partment, he rose to the 
rank of Lieutenant and re-
tired after 25 plus years on 
the job. He always looked 
back on his time in the de-
partment with fondness. 

Along with firefighting, 
Kippy owned and operat-
ed his own locksmith busi-
ness, MTK Locksmith, in 
which he was still work-
ing for over 40 years until 
his sudden death. 

When times got tough 
financially, Kippy would 
jump on a construction 
crew or grab a few more 
details down the track 
or plow snow to help his 
family get by. His son, Mi-
chael also worked along-
side him for many years. 
MTK Lock installed many 
locks on many houses in 
the Tri-Town Area, as well 
as  many businesses. He 
was talented in his trade 
and he was recommended 
by many not only for his 
honesty and knowledge, 
but you were guaranteed 
a laugh or two. One of 
his biggest and longest 
accounts was being the 
subcontracted locksmith 
for the Burlington Public 
Schools for many years.

He met many people 

through working in Burl-
ington and throughout the 
North Shore. These rela-
tionships and friendships 
were so valuable to him. 
It was all about “who ya 
know” with Kippy.

The greatest joys in life 
were his family. Kippy 
consistently talked about 
his family and how in-
credibly proud he was of 
them. 

He was so proud that 
Michael went to college, 
that he met his wife, Lau-
ren (the daughter he never 
had) and their life togeth-
er. He was overjoyed at 
the birth of his grandson, 
Michael. He treasured be-
ing a papa and being able 
to do many things with his 
grandson, including a re-
cent trip to Disney World 
with him in July. He was 
really starting to enjoy the 
benefits of all of his hard 
work over the years and 
beginning to start to enjoy 
a semi-retirement.

Although he moved 
to Chelmsford, his heart 
was still in Topsfield. He 
frequented the town often 
and looked forward to his 
time with his buddies for 
coffee. As he and MaryEl-
len grew older, they​ were 
able to travel, enjoy time 
together floating in the 
pool and they had many 
laughs along the way. 

Kippy will be remem-
bered for being a man 
who would help others, 
give advice and provide 
a “good joke” or two. He 
was proud of his accom-
plishments in life and the 
legacy he is living behind. 
He will be missed.

He was the beloved 
husband of 46 years to 
Mary Ellen (Haggerty) 
Kippenberger of Chelms-
ford, formerly of Tops-
field; loving and proud 
father of Michael T. Kip-
penberger and his wife, 
Lauren of Tewksbury, 
adored papa of Michael P. 
Kippenberger, dear broth-
er of Katherine M. Call 
and her husband, John D., 
Jr. of Danvers and the late 
Dr. Paul F. Kippenberg-
er, Jr.; cherished family 
friend of Kathy Ings “his 
other wife” and the Late 
Robert Ings of Billerica. 

He is also lovingly 
survived by many niec-
es, nephews, grandniec-
es, grandnephews, fellow 
brother and sister fire-
fighters, colleagues in the 
locksmith industry and 
countless friends. 

In lieu of flowers, re-
membrances may be made 
to the Disabled American 
Veterans, P.O. Box 14301, 
Cincinnati, OH 45250-
0301 by mail or by visit-
ing www.DAV.org. 

To send online condo-
lences, please visit  www.
vertuccioandsmith.com.

Funeral Arrangements 
entrusted to the care and 
direction of the Vertuccio 
& Smith, Home for Funer-
als.

Gerald Sasso
Former Revere Police Department 

Mechanic 

Paul Draper
Former proprietor of Headquarters on 

Broadway, Revere

Michael T. Kippenberger
Retired Revere Fire Department 

Lieutenant

OBITUARIES
All obituaries and death 

notices will be at a cost of 
$150.00 per paper. 

Includes photo.No word Limit. 
Please send to 

obits@reverejournal.com
or call 781-485-0588

TORF FUNERAL
SERVICE

Pre-need planning with our 
price protection guarantee. 

Arrangements made at our  
facility or in the comfort of  

your own home
4 generations of  the Torf  Tradition:

Deborah Torf  Golden    Amy Torf  Golden
Hyman J. Torf  (1903-2000)

M.L. Torf  (1867-1940)
Richard A. Pruneau

(617) 889-2900
(800)428-7161

www.torffuneralservice.com

Stephanie Lynne (Cra-
po) Orlandino, 40, of Re-
vere died suddenly on No-
vember 17.

Stephanie was a caring 
loving person. She loved 
the beach and all the beau-
ty and serenity it had to of-
fer. Stephanie also enjoyed 
drawing and expressing 
herself through art. Her 
creative and loving soul 
will live on through the 
hearts of her family and 

friends.
Stephanie is survived 

by her mother, Karen Cra-
po, her brother, Douglas 
Crapo and sister in-law, 
Natasha Crapo and her 
three sons: Michael, Con-
nor and Jackson.

Private services to be 
held in January.

The family requests all 
who knew her to keep her 
in your hearts.

A funeral will be con-
ducted today, Jaunuary 
4, at 10 a.m followed by 
a Funeral Service in the 
funeral home at 11 a.m. 
from the Vertuccio & 
Smith, Home for Funer-
als, 773 Broadway (Rt. 
107) Revere for Valerie G. 
(Paiva) Hudson who died 
on Tuesday, December 27 
at the Massachusetts Gen-
eral Hospital, after sus-
taining a fall at home. She 
was 76 years old.	

Interment will follow in  
Puritan Lawn Memorial 
Park, Peabody.

Valerie was born in 
Cambridge and lived in 
Revere all her life. She 
was educated in Revere 
Public Schools and was a 
graduate of Revere High 
School, Class of 1964. 
Following high school, 
she followed her passion 
and became a hairdresser. 
She worked as a hairdress-
er in Boston for Salon Mi-
rabella. 

She married the love of 
her life, Leslie W. “Bill” 
Hudson in 1968. They re-
mained in Revere where 
they raised their two chil-
dren together and made 
their home. 

Valerie provided a lov-
ing and nurturing home 
for her family and she 
loved cooking and baking 
for them all  the time. She 
was an incredible cook 
and enjoyed feeding fam-
ily and friends. She was 
fastidious about her home 
and while working full 
time, always kept it per-
fect. 

She was artistic in many 
ways and loved gardening 

and being surrounded by 
beautiful flowers. 	

She was also known 
for shopping for “things.” 
She will forever be re-
membered for cherishing 
her family, they meant the 
world to her.

The beloved wife of 54 
years of Leslie W. “Bill” 
Hudson, she was the lov-
ing mother of Kimberly 
A. Recupero and her hus-
band, Michael and Leslie 
W. “Billy” Hudson Jr., all 
of Revere, the cherished 
Nana of Joshua Recupero 
of Revere and Jeremy Re-
cupero of Everett. Valerie 
is also lovingly survived 
by her brothers and sisters 
in law and many nieces, 
nephews, grandnieces and 
grandnephews. 

In lieu of flowers, re-
membrances may be made 
to St. Jude Children’s Re-
search Hospital, 501 St. 
Jude Place, Memphis, TN 
38105 or by visitingwww.
stjude.org	

To send online condo-
lences, please visit: www.
vertuccioandsmith.com.	

Funeral arrangements 
entrusted to the care and 
direction of the Vertuccio 
& Smith, Home for Funer-
als.

Stephanie Lynne Orlandino
A caring loving person

Valerie Hudson
She will forever be remembered for 

cherishing her family, they meant the world 
to her

Friday will be three years 
since you flew away,

Into the arms of Jesus on that
Little Christmas Day.

You are an Angel Brother indeed,
a Miracle of God.

Tears still flow because you're not 
with me on this sod.

God sent you to bring a little bit of 
Heaven down.

Without you, life is a bit sadder and colder, I've found.
During the first year of tears, I wrote about you and me.

I know full well you're in the presence of God's Glory.
But it was a way to deal with my initial heart's despair.

And the book about you is now circulating out there.
I wanted the world to remember you and to see
What a joy and how much you meant to me.

You are greatly missed my sweet angel brother.
I know there is no need to fret or wonder.

I no longer need to worry about your well-being.
You are in the care of the Most High God, all-seeing

I miss your happy presence and your sweet voice.
Together one day we will sing and rejoice.

We will praise Jesus, and His sacrifice,
That gave us Hope and joy and Eternal Life.

Knowing Jesus, I persevere these earthly lonely days,
And one day, all sorrow will cease, replaced by praise.

Yes, one day, together, we will worship and behold the Lord.
Until that day, my sweet brother, I will trust His word.

Love you and miss you,  Lucia.

In Memory of

Anthony (NINO) Salvatore 
Nicola Mario Nittolo

He added warmth & kindness to the world 
from 9-24-1949 to 1- 6-2020
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Janis M. Cotter, O.D.
COMPREHENSIVE EYE EXAMS

Testing for glaucoma, cataracts, and diabetic eye disease. 
Contact Lens Consultations and Fittings 

Philip Cotter, R.D.O.
COMPLETE OPTICAL SERVICES

Eyewear for the Family • Eyeglasses repaired
Senior Discounts, Medicare, HMO’s, 
and many other insurances accepted.

PARKWAY OPTICAL  
and EYECARE

Established 1957

Mon  - Thurs: 8:00am - 5:00pm     Friday 8:00am – 12:00pm
Closed Saturday & Sunday

80 Broadway • Revere, MA
781-289-7929

parking spaces on the lot 
and the applicant  intends 
to add a third spot in the 
front  yard to the  right of 
the home. 

Catoggio also noted 
that "although the appli-
cant is an LLC, this will 
be an owner-occupied 
property."

He told the board that 
his client intends to con-
vert the existing four-bed-
room, single-family home 
into two units consisting 
of a three-bedroom unit 
and a one-bedroom unit, 
and therefore will neither 
be increasing the number 
of bedrooms on the prop-
erty nor expanding the 
structure's existing foot-
print.

He also added that there 
are a number of two-fami-
ly homes in the area.

Ward 6 Council-
lor Richard Serino filed a 
letter supporting the ap-
plication in view of the re-
vised plan for the project.

However, Ronald 
Champoux of 88 Stevens 
St., who spoke against 
the variance request at the 
November meeting,  still 
opposed the application 
on the basis that it will add 
to the parking congestion 
in the neighborhood.

"The rules say four 
spots are needed and that's 
the  only  way we realis-
tically  can support this 
proposal," said Cham-
poux, who added that the 
lack of parking is a city-
wide problem.

Boston attorney Rich-
ard  Joyce, representing 
Richard and  Christine 
Joyce of 178 Grover St., 
presented opposition to 
the application from a le-
gal perspective.

"Look at the full pic-
ture," said Joyce. "Your 
own regulations state that 
the applicant must demon-
strate that there is a spe-
cific shape, topography or 
other land or structures af-
fecting this property. They 
must show that there is a 

substantial hardship,  fi-
nancial or otherwise. But 
there has been zero evi-
dence of financial hard-
ship."  

He also cited the lack of 
parking in the neighbor-
hood.

  "This potentially will 
devalue other properties 
in the neighborhood," 
Joyce continued. "This 
is a substantial detriment 
to other homeowners  in 
the area. There is just no 
need to grant this. There 
is plenty  of parking for 
a one-family home and 
that's how it should re-
main."

The board  voted 3-2 
to reject the application, 
with Limeneh and Tuck-
er voting yes and Lopes, 
O'Brien, and Pelton vot-
ing no.

However, two other ap-
plicants that evening had 
better luck.

Robert Mahoney, of 
2 Paul Street, came be-
fore the board requesting 
a variance of RRO Sec-
tion 17.24.010, minimum 
lot frontage of 80 feet, to 
enable him to construct a 
single-family dwelling on 
Lots 142 & 144 Morris 
Street and a single-family 
dwelling on Lots 146 and 
148 Morris Street.

Mr. Mahoney present-
ed the application,  which 
also had been continued 

from the November meet-
ing. He pointed out that 
though the frontage for 
the proposed  house lots 
is only 71 feet, the other 
requirements for cover-
age area and setbacks are 
far exceeded.

"This will not be a detri-
ment for this to happen in 
this  neighborhood,"  said 
Mahoney.

Councillor Serino sub-
mitted a letter  in opposi-
tion,  noting the flooding 
in the neighborhood, and 
suggested that the drain-
age issue should be re-
solved before moving 
forward with the construc-
tion of new homes. 

Serino's letter echoed 
opposition from residents 
in the neighborhood who 
had been present at the 
November meeting. Their 
homes had been built by 
Mahoney and the parties 
presently are in litigation 
in Suffolk Superior Court 
regarding the flooding is-
sue.

However, the ZBA re-
ceived a letter from Frank 
Stringi, the Revere City 
Planner, informing the 
board that the city's en-
gineering department has 
approved a plan that will 
resolve the flooding prob-
lems in the area. He also 
noted that building homes 
on these two lots, which 
are at the bottom of the 

street, will not contribute 
to the drainage problems 
in the area.

Other than the letter 
from Serino, there was 
no further opposition 
presented at the meeting. 
The board  voted 4-1 to 
approve the application 
with only chairman Tuck-
er objecting.
The third and final mat-

ter, both for the evening 
and for 2022, was an appli-
cation by Ana Betancourt, 
200 Broad Sound Ave-
nue, who was requesting 
a special permit from the 
ZBA in accordance with 
RRO Section 17.40.040 to 
enable her to modify and 
extend a nonconforming 
single family structure by 
constructing a 255 sq. ft. 
addition (14’ x 18.2’) at 
200 Broad Sound Avenue.

Ms. Betancourt present-
ed the application to the 
board. She noted that the 
project will resolve a wa-
ter problem in the existing 
structure and will prevent 
water from getting  into 
her basement.

Ward 1 Councillor Jo-
anne McKenna sent in a 
letter to the board stat-
ing that she has no prob-
lem  with the  application. 
There were no opponents.

The board voted 5-0 to 
approve the project.

OBITUARIES

Real Estate Transfers
BUYER 1	 SELLER 1	 ADDRESS	   PRICE   
Cohan, Gabriella	 Considine, John	 14 Pier View Ave            	 $330,000 
Villanueva, Reyes D     	 Kaur, Mahinder   	 115 Garfield Ave            	 $510,000  
Soriano, Pedro           	 Arrowhead Builders LLC	 133 Breedens Ln        	 $850,000  
Shipers, Jing	 Chan, James	 175 Ward St #35         	 $186,000  
Route 1A Owner LLC	 Ok Ventures Inc	 186-A Lee Burbank Hwy     	 $7,600,000  

 thinking of selling?

11 years of experience   |   978.423.7782   |   nick@broadsoundre.com

NICK DAHER BROKER/OWNER

A Proud Revere Resident and Your Trusted Realtor

ZBA //  CONTINUED FROM PAGE 1

OBITUARIES
All obituaries and death 

notices will be at a cost of 
$150.00 per paper. 

Includes photo.No word Limit. 
Please send to 

obits@reverejournal.com
or call 781-485-0588

Sheila F. (Donnelly) 
Meaney of Revere, 86, 
died on Tuesday, Decem-
ber 27. 

The wife of the late 
Francis X. Meaney, she 
was born in Cambridge, 
the daughter of the late 
James Arthur and Olive 
(Hand) Donnelly. She had 
worked as a secretary for 
the V.A. and Social Secu-
rity Departments.

Sheila is survived by 
five children: Julie Foulds 
of Saugus, Tricia Donnel-
ly of Conway, NH, Ann 
Marie Brown of Peabody, 
David Meaney and his 
wife, Janet of North Port, 
FL and Susan Meaney 
DVM of Beverly; eight 
grandchildren: Meaghan, 
Donny, Joseph, Terrance, 
Connor, Jillian, Jonathan 
and Jack and nine great 
grandchildren, Sean, 
Nicolas, Christopher, 
Isla, Zachary, Jake, Lila, 
Makayla and Tyler. She 
was predeceased by her 
daughter, Kathleen Or-
landella, son-in-law, Don-
ald P. Foulds, grandson, 
Patrick M. Connors; four 

brothers, Robert, Edward, 
Buddy and David Donnel-
ly; two sisters, Ann Marie 
Porterfield and Dorothy 
Mulloy.
In lieu of flowers, dona-

tions in Sheila’s memory 
may be made to the Fisher 
House of Boston at fisher-
houseboston.org.

Relatives and friends 
are invited to attend vis-
iting hours in the Bis-
bee-Porcella Funeral 
Home on Thursday, Janu-
ary 5 from 4 to 6 p.m. fol-
lowed by a service in the 
funeral home at 6 p.m. For 
directions and condolenc-
es  www.BisbeePorcella.
com.

Family and friends 
are respectfully 

invited to at-
tend Visiting 
Hours on Sun-

day, January 8  from 2 to 
6 p.m. in Vazza’s “Beech-
wood” Funeral Home, 
262 Beach St., Revere for 
Felice “Phil” Barletta who 
died unexpectedly at his 
home on Sunday, Janu-
ary 1    at 91 years old. A 
funeral will be conducted 
from the funeral home on 
Monday, January 9 begin-
ning at 9 a.m., followed by 
a Funeral Mass in St. An-
thony of Padua Church, 
250 Revere St., Revere at 
10 a.m. Interment will fol-
low with Military Honors 
in Woodlawn Cemetery, 
Everett.

Phil was born in East 
Boston on August 30, 
1931, to the late Domeni-
co and Agnes (Vitale) Bar-
letta. He was one of four 
children. He then enlisted 
in the United States Army 
in 1948. While serving in 
Germany, he met and mar-
ried the love of his life, 
Anneliese (Meissner). 
The couple lived in East 
Boston, where they raised 
their three daughters.  Phil 
worked as a Master Ma-
chinist. After he retired, 
his hobbies included tak-
ing day trips to Boston, 
boating and he especially 
loved his family, and be-
ing with them.

The beloved husband 
of 60 years of the late 
Anneliese (Meissner) 
Barletta, he was the lov-

ing father of Evelyn Bar-
letta–Auld and her hus-
band, John of Rockland, 
Donna Saraceno and her 
husband, Robert J. of 
Saugus and Lisa Tracia 
and her partner, John A. 
Norton, II of Saugus; the 
grandfather of Erica Rago 
and her husband, James, 
Stephen Apicco and his 
wife, Denise, Christopher 
Saraceno and Robyn Ber-
ry, Robert Saraceno and 
his wife, Lisa and Nicole 
Tracia and her partner, 
Jeff Black; the treasured 
great grandfather of Evan, 
Ashlyn, Isabelle, Juliette, 
Delilah, Christian, Anne-
liese, Christopher, Jr. Jake 
and Nathan and the dear 
brother of Agnes Barletta 
and the late Nicholas An-
thony Barletta. He is also 
lovingly survived by his 
companion, Nina Preston.
In lieu of flowers, re-

membrances may be made 
to the Wounded Warrior 
Project P.O. Box 758516, 
Topeka, Kansas 66675-
8516. For online guest 
book and condolences, 
please visit www.vazzafu-
nerals.com   

Eunice G. (Glick) 
Kriedberg, of Revere, wife 
of the late Henry J. Kried-
berg, passed away on Dec. 
6. She was 90 years old.

Born in Winthrop, Eu-
nice was the daughter 
of the late Rudolph and 
Sadye Glick. Eunice grad-
uated from Revere High 
School in 1950. She and 
her husband shared 45 
years of marriage.

Eunice was a devoted 
mother and homemaker 
and raised four children, 
David Kreed, Karen Berg, 
Robert Kriedberg, and 
Steven Kriedberg. She 
was also the sister of Di-
anne Emerson.

Eunice and her family 
lived in West Peabody for 
10 years before returning 
to Revere in 1971. The 
family enjoyed many hap-
py times together. Eunice 
had a wonderful sense of 
humor and a great laugh. 
She always put others first 
and had a nice, kind way 
about her.

Her son, Robert, re-
called how the children 
would often jest with their 
mother that her initials 
once spelled “EGG” (Eu-
nice Gloria Glick).

Eunice lived at the Jack 
Satter House where her 
smile and spirit will be 
missed. Eunice was also 

a loyal fan of the New 
England Patriots and the 
Boston Celtics.

Eunice was also ad-
mired deeply by her 
grandchildren, Keith Ryan 
and his wife, Sue, Daniel 
Berg, and Jacob Berg, her 
great-grandchildren, Ju-
lianna Ryan, Jesse Ryan, 
and the late Jason Ryan, 
her daughter-in-law, the 
late Kathleen Kriedberg, 
and son-in-law, the late 
Jeffrey Berg.

Eunice Kriedberg will 
be remembered fondly by 
all who were graced by 
her presence in their lives.

Graveside services 
were held Dec. 12 at New 
Tifereth Israel of Revere 
Cemetery in Everett.

Donations in memory 
of Eunice Kriedberg can 
be made to: Dementia 
Society of America, P.O. 
Box 600, Doylestown, PA 
18901.

Linda A. (Neville) 
Doherty of Winthrop, for-
merly of Revere, passed 
away on January 1. She 
was 75 years old.

The beloved wife of 
51 years to Cornelius J. 
Doherty, she was born 
in Boston, the cher-
ished daughter of the late 
William and Elizabeth 
(Palmgren) Neville.

Linda was happily em-
ployed for 36 years as a 
Financial Librarian for the 
Eaton Vance Investment 
Co. of Boston. She loved 
spending time with her 
family, reading, traveling, 
telling amazing stories, 
attending theatre/shows 
and watching her kids and 
grandkids play sports.

Linda was the devot-
ed mother of Shannon E. 
Doherty of Revere and 
Todd N. Doherty and his 
wife, Jessica of Lynn-
field. She was the adored 
grandmother of Hannah 
and Brandon Doherty. She 
was the dear sister in law 
to Ann Marie Jenkins and 
loving aunt to Jeremy Jen-
kins.

Visiting hours will be 
held in the Maurice W. 
Kirby Funeral Home, 210 
Winthrop St.,

Winthrop on Monday, 
January 9  from 4 to 8 p.m. 
Linda’s Funeral Mass will 
be celebrated in St. Mi-
chael’s Parish (St. John the 
Evangelist Church) 320 
Winthrop St. ,Winthrop on 
Tuesday, January 10  at 10 
a.m. Relatives and friends 
are invited. Please go di-
rectly to church. Interment 
will be in Winthrop Cem-
etery (Belle Isle Section).

For Linda’s guestbook 
and directions, please vis-
it :www.mauricekirbyfh.
com

Sheila Meaney
Retired secretary

Felice “Phil” Barletta
Retired Master Machinest

Eunice Kriedberg
Loving and devoted mother and 

homemaker, long-time resident

Linda Doherty
Retired Eaton Vance Financial Librarian
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REVERE BEACH WINTER WONDERLAND

Conveniently located On The Blue Line

• PICK-UP & DELIVERY
SAFE DEPENDABLE QUALITY REPAIRS

with a lifetime Guarantee
Licensed • Bonded • Insured

Registered by the
Commonwealth of Massachusetts

Reg. #3053 
1456 NORTH SHORE RD., REVERE • 781-289-1300

Bob Bolognese
Owner

WWW.BOBSAUTOBODY.COM

Photos by Marianne Salza

Revere Beach Part-
nership, in collaboration 
with Next Stop Revere, 
and Waterfront Square 
Businesses hosted Revere 
Beach Winter Wonderland 
on December 31. Four ice 
sculptures displayed at 
Revere Beach and Won-
derland Stations joined 
the 33 featured through-
out Boston. Friends and 
families enjoyed a live 
ice carving demonstration 
and free hot chocolate at 
Dryft Revere. Specialty 
eggnog drinks were also 

served at Mission Beach 
House, with 50-percent of 
the proceeds benefitting 
the Revere Beach Partner-
ship.

“We are a non-profit 
organization that focus-
es on public access to the 
Boston waterfront for res-
idents and visitors. This 
year, marks the 10th anni-
versary of the New Year’s 
Eve Ice Sculpture Stroll 
across the waterfront,” 
said Christian Merfeld, 
Communications Direc-
tor, Boston Harbor Now.

Siblings, Audrey, 6, and Nichols Gregorio, 3, of 
Revere, hugging in front of an ice sculpture on 
the Markey Memorial Bridge.

Ada Mai, Jonathan, Phebe, and Michael Wu posing with an ice sculp-
ture on the Christina and John Markey Memorial Bridge, presented 
by Revere Beach Partnership.

Revere resident, Abigail Murray, 7, peeking through an ice sculpture on display at Dryft 
Revere.

Revere residents, Anita, Chloe, 5, and Iliana Anchundia, 9, posing with an ice sculpture 
outside Dryft Revere.

Dan Maguire, of Revere, looking through an ice sculpture 
on Revere Beach.

Friends, Debby Krim and Mary Lou McGonigle, enjoying a 
free hot chocolate after brunch at Dryft Revere.

Chloe Anchundia, 5, of Revere, touching an ice sculpture 
outside Dryft Revere.

Visitors, including former State Rep. Kathi Reinstein (right) admiring an ice sculpture on 
Revere Beach on New Year’s Eve day 2022.

Karen Toomey, Merry Penta, Joy Toomey, Laurie Pelletier, and Kate Toomey enjoying coco-
nut eggnog martinis after brunch at Mission Beach House.

A new year ice sculpture on display at Revere Beach Sta-
tion.

Mission Beach House bartenders, Dante DeCologero and 
Rhyeen Brinson.

An ice sculpture of the Cyclone roller coaster, sponsored by 
Next Stop Revere, outside Revere Beach Station.
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SportsSports

DON’T WAIT! RESERVE YOUR SPACE NOW AND GET YOUR 
AD IN THE EYES OF THOUSANDS. CALL 781-485-0588

RESERVE YOUR SPACE NOW!

RHS SPORTS Roundup REVERE PATRIOTS BASKETBALL TRIUMPH OVER EASTIE AT
DAVID L. GREEN MEMORIAL BASKETBALL TOURNAMENT

PHOTOS BY BOB MARRA

35 REVERE ST., WINTHROP • (617) 846-6880
WWW.WINTHROPMKTPLACE.COM

New Store Hours starting June 22: Mon-Sat 7:30 am-8pm;
Sun: 7:30am-7pm

 Not responsible for typographical errors.   
We have the right to limit quantities.

Grocery
Great grocery specials

Deli

Your Independent Grocer, Where Old Friends Meet And New Ones Are Made
SALE DAYS THURSDAY, JANUARY 5TH, THROUGH WEDNESDAY JANUARY 11TH 2023

Hans Kissle Cranberry Walnut 
Chicken Salad.................................................$11.99/lb
Russer Virginia Style Baked Ham ................$6.99/lb
Kretschmar Rotisserie Chicken Breast ..... $8.99/lb
Weaver Chicken Roll ........................................$6.99/lb
Russer Cooked Salami ................................... $4.99/lb

Weekend Specials
Friday, January 6th through Sunday January 8th

"while supplies last"

Produce
Jumbo Seedless Navel Oranges ...................$1.69/lb
"Pick your Own" Red Potatoes .........................99¢/lb
Fresh Eggplant ................................................ $1.49/lb
Fresh & Tasty Bite Size 
Grape Tomato Pint .........................................2/$4.00
Whole Butternut Squash ..................................79¢/lb

Bakery

BAKERY
Our Own Bagels 4pk All Varieties .................. $2.99
8" Cherry Pie ...................................................... $7.99

DELI
Carolina Deluxe Turkey Breast ...................$6.99/lb
Best Yet Roast Beef ................................. $10.99/lb

PRODUCE
Florida Fresh & Sweet Ripe
Strawberries 1lb Pkg ......................$3.99 limit 2pkgs
Sweet & Crunchy Red Seedless Grapes .... $2.29/lb

MEAT
Family Pack 85% Ground Beef ...................$4.99/lb
Best Yet Cooked Shrimp 51-60 ct  ................ $7.99

GROCERY
Hellmann's Mayonnaise 30oz.  .......................$5.99
Hood Ice Cream  .............................................2/$7.00
Best yet Butter Quarters (ex. unsalted) ...2/$8.00

Oakrun Crumpets .................................................$2.49 
Chabaso Cranberry Pecan Bread ........................$5.49 
Juniors Cheese Cake  4 oz .............................2/$6.00

Meat
"Meat Cut Fresh Every Day"

Boneless Chuck Steaks ............................... $6.99/lb
Center Cut Boneless Pork Chops ................$1.99/lb
Boneless Skinless Chicken Thighs ..............$2.59/lb

Boneless Chuck Pot Roast ...........................$5.99/lb
Grade A Whole Fryer Chickens .....................$1.99/lb

Family Pack SpecialsB&M Baked Beans  16 oz ...............................2/$3.00
Skippy Peanut Butter ......................................2/$4.00
Green Mountain K-Cups ....................................... $7.99 
Motts Apple Juice  64 oz ............................... 2/$5.00
Hunts Ketchup  20 oz ..................................... 4/$5.00
Hunts Snack Packs .......................................... 4/$5.00
Vlassic Pickles ..................................................2/$6.00
Wishbone Salad Dressing  8 oz .....................2/$4.00
Chicken of the Sea Chunk Light Canned Tuna ...4/$5.00
Pennsylvania Dutch Noodles ..........................2/$4.00
Eggo Thick & Fluffy Waffles .............................2/$6.00
Newman's Cauliflower Pizza ................................ $7.99 
McCain's French Fries .....................................2/$6.00
Philadelphia Soft Cream Cheese Tub .............2/$7.00
Fage Greek Yogurt ........................................... 4/$5.00
Silk Milk  64 oz ..................................................2/$7.00

Revere High School

ATHLETE
Of The Month

Revere High School

ATHLETE
Of The Month

Revere High School

ATHLETE
Of The Month

JANUARYJANUARY

The Revere High female athlete 
of the month is sophomore track 
star Liv Yuong. Liv was undefeat-

ed in December in both of her 
events, the hurdles and the high 
jump, scoring 10 points in both 

of the Lady Patriots’ indoor track 
meets against GBL rivals Everett 

and Somerville.

The Revere High male athlete of 
the month is senior basketball 

captain Domenic Boudreau. 
Domenic is a returning GBL 

all-star who has led the way for 
the Patriots to their 4-2 start this 
season. In the recent David Green 
Tournament in Winthrop, Domenic 
scored 24 points vs. East Boston 
in a victory in the opening round.

The Revere High athletes of the month are 
LIV YOUNG & DOMENIC BOUDREAU

r e v e r e  s c h o o l
c o m m i t t e e 

m e m b e r

J O H N
K I N G S T O N

S p o n s o r e d  b yS p o n s o r e d  b y

J O H N
K I N G S T O N

4-2 RHS BOYS 
HOOP RESUMES 
GBL SCHEDULE

The 4-2 Revere High 
boys basketball team was 
set to return to action this 
week against its Great-
er Boston League (GBL) 
opponents after a string of 
three non-league contests.

Last week, coach Da-
vid Leary and his Patriots 
played in the second an-
nual David Green Tourna-
ment in Winthrop. Revere 
topped East Boston in the 
opening round, 67-51, but 
came  up short against 
a hot-shooting Saugus 
squad in the championship 
game, 67-47.

The Patriots were set 
to host GBL foe Lynn 
English, the third-ranked 
team in the state that has 
outscored its opponents 
by an average score of 
89-41 en route to compil-
ing a 6-0 record, last night 
(Tuesday).

They will travel to Med-
ford tomorrow evening 
(Thursday) and then will 
make the short ride down 
Broadway to Chelsea next 
Tuesday.

 
RHS GIRLS LOOK
TO GET BACK ON 
TRACK

The Revere High girls 
basketball team will be 
looking to return to the 
win column when the 
Lady Patriots resume their 
schedule against Greater 
Boston League (GBL) op-
ponents this week.

Coach Chris Porrazzo 
and his crew were set to 
take on Lynn English yes-
terday (Tuesday) evening 
and will host Medford at 
the Merullo Fieldhouse 
tomorrow (Thursday) eve-
ning at 6:00. They will en-

tertain non-league oppo-
nent Lowell next Monday 
and GBL foe Chelsea next 
Tuesday.

The Lady Patriots 
hosted the Revere Holi-
day Tournament over the 
break. Revere played MIl-
ton in the opening round 
and came out on the short 
end of a 46-25 decision.

Junior captain Haley 
Belloise led Revere with 
nine points and grabbed 
four rebounds. Sophomore 
captain Belma Velic add-
ed six points, snared four 
boards, and blocked eight 
Milton shots. Sophomore 
Lea Doucete chipped 
in four points, three re-
bounds, and four steals.

"Obviously a tough 
game for us," said Por-
razzo. "Our inexperience 
showed. We were down a 
starter and everyone's role 
had to shift. Going for-
ward we have to learn to 
adapt better. Milton plays 
in a very tough league 
and all of their strengths 
shined against us. They 
are a talented and well-
coached team."

Milton went on to beat 
Saugus, which had ad-
vanced to the final with a 
59-50 win over New Mis-
sion High, to win the tour-
nament championship, 
42-28.  

In the consolation game, 
the Lady Patriots dropped 
a hard-fought, 35-32 deci-
sion to New Mission. 

Velic led Revere in the 
scoring column with 12 
points. Belma also pulled 
down eight rebounds and 
blocked two shots. Fresh-
man Shayna Smith turned 
in a nice double-double 
with 10 points and 10 re-
bounds. Shayna also made 

See ROUNDUP Page 10

WINNING THE ARMS RACE:  Dom Boudreau gets above 
the crowd to grab one of his 8 rebounds to go along with 
24 points that led Revere to a 67-51 win over East Boston 
in the David L. Green Memorial Basketball Tournament 
Wednesday, December 28 at Winthrop High.

HEAVY TRAFFIC:  Revere’s Vincent Nichols (0) is caught 
between a pair of East Boston defenders including Isaiah 
Fisher (13)

LUCKY 13s:  East Boston’s Isaiah Fisher (13) goes up and 
over Revere’s Vinny Lu (13) in a battle for a rebound.

KEEP AWAY:  Vincent Nichols (0) snags a rebound from East 
Boston forward Javon Wise Normil.
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two steals.
"This was a highly com-

petitive and close game," 
noted Porrazzo, whose 
squad stands at 1-4 overall 
and 1-2 in the GBL. "We 
were once again down a 
starter, but we adapted 
better in this game. We 
had control, but then got 
outscored 10-4 in the final 
frame. We lost our poise 
there in the end, but we are 
doing our best to take it as 
a learning experience."

RHS TRACK TEAMS
HOST ENGLISH 
TODAY

The Revere High girls 
and boys indoor track & 
field teams will return to 
the track after the holi-
day break when they host 
Lynn English this evening 
(Wednesday) at the Mer-
ullo Fieldhouse.

Coach Racquel Mac-
Donald's girls squad and 
coach David Fleming's 
boys will travel to Med-
ford next Wednesday.

REVERE PATRIOTS BASKETBALL TRIUMPH OVER EASTIE AT DAVID L. GREEN 
MEMORIAL BASKETBALL TOURNAMENT

Photos by Bob Marra

Revere ran out to a 14-0 
lead and never looked 
back as the Patriots topped 
East Boston 67-51 in the 
opening game of the 2022 

David L. Green Memori-
al Basketball Tournament 
Wednesday, December 28 
at Winthrop High.  Saugus 
won the tournament with 
a 67-47 win over Revere 
Thursday December 29.

LOOSE BALL:  East Boston’s Robin Cartegena and Revere’s Maykin 
Funez-Gonzalez fight for a loose ball.

ON TARGET:  Vinny Lu (13) feeds a pass headed for 
Revere’s Ethan Day (4).

THREE ON THREE:  Revere’s Alejandro Hincapie makes a 
move on his opposite number 3, Eastie’s Xander Boutros.

PROTECTING THE END:  Revere’s Sal DeAngelis guards East 
Boston’s Angel Franco.

MAKING SPACE:  Vincent Nichols (0) takes a shot as he gets 
away from East Boston’s Xander Boutros.

IN THE HUNT:  East Boston’s Robin Cartegena (22) and 
Revere’s Luke Ellis (14)chase down a loose ball.

KEEPING ARMS LENGTH:  Ethan Day (4) guards East Bos-
ton’s Angel Franco.
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RHS SPORTS Through the Years

10 years ago
January 2, 2013
The Revere High boys 

basketball team enjoyed 
an outstanding holiday 
week, capturing the Pope 
John XXIII Christmas 
Tournament with victories 
over the host team in the 
opening round and Lynn-
field in the championship 
encounter.  In addition to 
winning the team title, 
three Patriots were sin-
gled out for selection to 
the tourney all-star team, 
led by Mike Ciambelli, 
who was named the tour-
nament MVP.  Teammates 
Dom Boyce and Geo Go-
mez joined Ciambelli in 
earning all-tourney acco-
lades.  Ciambelli snared 
the offensive rebound off 
a teammate’s missed shot 
and put it back to give 
Revere a 63-62 lead with 
40 seconds  to  play and 
then on  PJ’s next posses-
sion, drew an offensive 
foul.   Boyce was high 
scorer with 17 points, in-
cluding three treys. Mike 
Dreeszen also drained a 
trio of threes to finish with 
11 points. In the champi-
onship match with Lyn-
nfield, a 65-59 win,  Ci-
ambelli and Geo Gomez 

shared scoring honors 
with 14 points apiece. 

The Revere High girls 
basketball team grabbed 
all of the Christmas gifts 
under the tree at the Pope 
John XXIII High School 
Tiger Classic Holiday 
Tournament, capturing 
the championship and 
receiving the top indi-
vidual accolade with the 
naming of senior guard 
Gena Restiano as the 
tourney MVP.  The Lady 
Patriots got off to a fast 
start in the opening game 
against Pope John.  Res-
tiano topped the scoring 
chart with 14 points and 
added four steals and five 
assists. Fellow senior cap-
tain Caitlyn Caramello hit 
for double figures with 11 
points and pulled down 
eight rebounds. Amy Rot-
ger also had a nice night 
with nine points and eight 
boards. Both Caitlyn and 
Amy joined Restiano on 
the all-tourney team.  In 
the championship game 
with Lynnfield on Fri-
day, strong foul shooting 
proved to be a key for the 
Lady Patriots, who sank 
20-of-26 from the charity 
stripe, en route to a 53-
42 victory.  Offensive re-

bounding also was a big 
factor in the victory, as the 
Lady Patriots dominated 
the offensive boards, col-
lecting 20 for the game. 
Caramello alone snared 
nine offensive caroms.

Restiano once again led 
the point parade with 16 
points, plus five rebounds 
and five steals. Caramello 
came through with a nice 
double-double with 12 
points and 14 rebounds. 

RHS 4 x 200 relay sets 
new school mark

Just two weeks after 
setting a new Revere High 
school indoor record in 
the 4 x 200 relay, the quar-
tet of Joe Ritchie, Younes 
Hartout, Bobby Rose, 
and Johnny Lopes did it 
again over the weekend 
in the Holiday Qualifier 
Meet.  When the quartet 
first set the new mark, they 
did so in a time of 1:34.84. 
But Saturday they bettered 
that clocking by 0.43 sec-
onds for a new standard of 
1:34.41.

Although the Revere 
High hockey team still 
is searching for its first 
win of the season, RHS 
head coach Joe Ciccarel-
lo said he is pleased with 
the progress his team has 

been making after a 2-2 tie 
with Salem this week on 
goals by Cam Whalen and 
Shane Cambria.

30 years ago
January 6, 1993
After losses of 11-0 

and 12-2 to Medford and 
Somerville, the RHS 
hockey team stands at 0-6.

The RHS boys basket-
ball team also is winless 
after a 44-36 loss to Sau-
gus.

40 years ago
January 5, 1983
Led by victories by Ron 

Lusso in the 45 yard dash 
in 5.6, Rob DeSisto in the 
300 in 34.1, and Mark 
Fortuna in the 45 yard hur-
dles in 6.6, the RHS boys 
indoor track team took a 
giant step toward a GBL 
title with a 47-39 upset of 
Medford. Revere won the 
final event, the relay, when 
a Medford anchor leg 
runner was ruled to have 
stepped off the track while 
passing the Revere runner.

RHS boys hoop coach 
Kevin McCann earned 
his first victory when the 
Patriots defeated Malden 
Catholic 68-61. Wayne 
Chainey scored 20 points 

and Jack Johnson add-
ed 18 for the Pats. John 
Moschella with 14 points 
and Paul Dione with 12 
also hit for double figures.

Neil Craig netted a hat 
trick and Darren Merrill 
made 35 saves to lead the 
RHS hockey team to a 5-2 
win over Malden.

50 years ago
January 4, 1973
Mike Myers scored 25 

points and pulled down 17 
rebounds, but the Immac-
ulate Conception High 
basketball team dropped 
a 63-58 decision to North 
Cambridge Catholic.

Tom Guarino scored 
two goals and Bill White 
scored one to give the 
RHS hockey team a 3-0 
win over a highly-regard-
ed Medford squad. Bill 
Gaffney earned the shut-
out in net. Revere remains 
tied for first place in the 
GBL.

60 years ago
January 3, 1963
The 4-0-1 Revere High 

hockey team is in first 
place in the Metropolitan 
Hockey League after a 
5-0 win over previously 
undefeated Quincy. Goal-

ie Dick Vitale earned the 
shutout. Ted Prizio, John 
Mannone, Harvey Ter-
ban, Jim Palumbo, and 
Don Collins scored for 
Revere. Revere has dom-
inated its opponents, out-
scoring them 30-7 thus 
far. Revere last won a 
league title in 1947 under 
coach Allen Parker in the 
newly-formed No. Shore 
League. Present coach 
Jerry Moschella was a 
sophomore on that team.

70 years ago
January 7, 1953
A stick to the head of 

Revere High hockey play-
er Hudson at the end of 
the game resulted in a fra-
cas between Revere and 
Peabody players which 
also saw fans from both 
sides spill onto the ice. 
The same teams engaged 
in a bruising battle a year 
ago that also ended up in a 
riot. The contest ended in 
a 1-1 tie, leaving Revere 
still undefeated this sea-
son. Kenney Feyler scored 
the goal for Coach George 
Horner's Revere squad.

By Kim Salerno, Founder/CEO 

TripsWithPets

We all make some type 
of New Year’s resolu-
tion. We set goals for our-
selves to eat healthier, lose 
weight, spend less time on 
our phones, exercise more, 
be more mindful – yada 
yada yada. Well, it doesn't 
stop with just us. With all 
the unconditional love and 
joy pets bring us, an over-
whelming number of pet 
parents also set New Year’s 
resolutions for their pets.

There are countless 
ways that we can further 
enrich the lives of our 
pets. What better time to 
get started than the New 
Year ahead.

TripsWithPets surveyed 

pet parents to find out 
what their New Year’s res-
olutions are for their furry 
family members in 2023. 
Here are the top 5.

#1 Do more together
There’s no better way 

to bond more with your 
pet than engaging in new 
activities together. Top 
spot on the resolution list 
for pet parents in 2023 is 
taking more pet-friendly 
road trips and exploring 
new things to do with their 
pets. Paddleboarding, kay-
aking, hiking, and explor-
ing pet-friendly places to 
shop, dine, and stay are 
among the activities noted.

#2 Introduce natural 

ways to support pet 
health

Loving our pets as we 
do means doing all we can 
to ensure they lead long, 
healthy, and happy lives. 
Many pet parents have 
resolved to take a clos-
er look at natural health 
care for their furry family 
members. This includes 
their pets diet/nutrition, 
supplements, lifestyle, 
and alternative therapies – 
such as acupuncture, laser 
treatment, homeopathy, 
and the like. Improving 
our precious pets' well-be-
ing is the ultimate goal.

#3 Brush pet’s teeth 
regularly

Daily brushing of your 

pet’s teeth is just as im-
portant for him as it is for 
you. Regular tooth brush-
ing helps to prevent gum 
disease – and even other 
diseases. Yet, many pet 
parents overlook it. 

What makes it a bit tricky 
is if you don’t start your pet 
out when he is young, it 
becomes more challenging 
to make him amenable to 
getting his teeth brushed as 
he gets older. That’s what 
typically makes many pet 
parents “intermittent” tooth 
brushers. 

The good news is, 
News Year’s resolution #3 
is that pet parents plan to 
commit daily to brushing 
their dog’s and cat’s teeth.

#4 Get more exercise
We all need to move 

our bodies more - and 
that includes our pets. 
It’s not just about losing 
weight, it’s about overall 
health - mind, body, and 
soul. Getting out for more 
walks, play dates, fetch, 
and games of "hide and 
go treat" are on the docket 
for more pet parents in this 
coming year.

#5 Work on better 
manners & training
Whether it is barking 

at house guests, begging 
at the table, or bossing 
you around, most pets 
have some unfavorable 
behaviors that need to be 
curbed. Pet parents have 

committed to working 
with professional trainers 
this new year to help their 
pets with anxiety and be-
havior issues so they can 
be happier, more relaxed, 
and responsive. 

Yappy New Year!
TripsWithPets is a lead-

er in the pet travel indus-
try – providing online res-
ervations at pet-friendly 
hotels across the United 
States and Canada.

As passionate animal 
advocates, TripsWithPets 
supports local and nation-
al 501(c)(3) animal wel-
fare organizations by rais-
ing much needed funds 
through their annual Part-
ners for Animal Welfare 
Series (PAWS)

Top five pet new year’s resolutions for 2023

COUNCIL TO 
BEGIN SEARCH 
PROCESS FOR NEW 
CITY MANAGER

CHELSEA - When the 
City Council convenes for 
the new year, it will have 
a big task on its hands – 
beginning the search for a 
new City Manager.

Earlier this month, cur-
rent City Manager Thom-
as Ambrosino announced 
he will be beginning a new 
position on Jan. 30 as the 
Court Administrator of the 
Trial Court for Massachu-
setts.

“We have asked Tom 
to submit a formal letter 
of resignation so we can 
move forward with the 
process,” said Council 
President Calvin Brown.

As the Council moves 
forward with the hiring 
process, Brown said Dep-
uty City Manager Ned 
Keefe will handle much of 
the day-to-day business of 
the city manager’s office.

“He’ll be able to focus 
on a lot of projects over 
the next six months that 
are already underway,” 
said Brown. Having the 
deputy city manager in 
place will help make the 
transition to a new city 
manager easier when the 
time comes, Brown said.

Brown said he has been 
through the city manager 
selection process twice, 
and that the city has been 
fortunate with those two 

selections, Ambrosino, 
and before him, Jay Ash.

The process for hiring 
the next city manager will 
likely be similar to the one 
used to hire Ambrosino in 
2015, with a steering com-
mittee and heavy commu-
nity involvement, Brown 
said.

“We need to select a 
person who cares about 
Chelsea and focuses on 
Chelsea and doesn’t just 
see it as a stepping stone,” 
said Brown. “We’ve been 
fortunate that we’ve had 
two great city managers.”

The candidates will 
need to focus on the unique 
population of Chelsea and 
the many challenges the 
city faces, from affordable 
housing and mental health 
issues, to the city’s small 
businesses and active non-
profit community.

“The challenge we have 
is that the process has to 
be fair and involve the 
community,” said Brown.

With a number of 
changes across city de-
partments, Brown said 
the new city manager will 
also have the opportuni-
ty to form his or her own 
team, much as Ambrosi-
no did when he started in 
Chelsea.

The next scheduled 
City Council meeting is 
the special meeting on 
Tuesday, Jan. 3, when the 
council will nominate and 
elect the new president, 
vice president, and rep-

resentative to the School 
Committee.

Brown said it current-
ly looks like Council-
or-at-Large Leo Robinson, 
the council’s longest-serv-
ing member, has the votes 
to succeed him as council 
president.

EVERETT WORKER 
SAVES FAMILY 

EVERETT - On Thurs-
day morning, Dec. 22, 
Parking Enforcement Of-
ficer for the City of Ever-

ett Brian Gianelli prevent-
ed tragedy at a 2-alarm fire 
at a multi-unit residence 
on Vine Street.

While he was doing his 
overnight shift, Gianelli 
smelled and spotted smoke 
coming from the building 
and quickly sprang into 
action by calling the Ever-
ett Fire Department (EFD) 
and alerting residents to 
the danger to ensure they 
got out safely.

“I was in the right place 
at the right time,” said Gi-
anelli. He also told NBC10 
Boston, “There were 

alarms going off, couldn’t 
tell from what. I got them 
up, got them out,” he re-
called. “And second floor, 
and I said, ‘You got to get 
out, we have a fire.’”

The EFD quickly re-
sponded with help from 
Metro Boston mutual aid 
to get the fire under con-
trol. Firefighters also did 
all they could to save the 
presents under the Christ-
mas tree on the first floor.  

Mayor Carlo DeMaria 
expressed his gratitude to 
Gianelli and the firefight-
ers who responded to the 

fire. 
“As we all celebrate this 

season, let’s be thankful 
for the people like Brian 
and our first responders 
for keeping us all safe,” 
said Mayor DeMaria. 

MASSDOT  LOOKS 
AT USE OF 
OLD RAIL LINE 
CORRIDOR

EAST BOSTON - It’s 
still in the early stages, but 
MassDOT is coming to 

NEWS FROM AROUND THE REGION

East Boston Central Catholic School (EBCCS) presented its holiday show, “It’s Beginning To Look A Lot Like Christmas,” on 
December 16.  EBCCS Choir singing, “Rudolph the Red Nosed Reindeer.” 

EAST BOSTON CENTRAL CATHOLIC SCHOOL
HOLDS HOLIDAY SHOW

See YEARS Page 14
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Staff Report 

The MBTA announced 
upcoming service changes 
this month on the Orange, 
Green, and Red lines. Be-
cause of the continued 
demolition of the Govern-
ment Center Garage by 
private developer HYM 
Construction, Orange 
and Green Line service 
changes will take place in 
January in the downtown 
Boston area. Additional-
ly, the Medford Branch 
of the Green Line will be 
replaced with shuttle bus 
service from start to end 

of service on Sunday, Jan-
uary 8, to accommodate 
water line work. The Red 
Line will also experience 
service changes during 
the weekend of January 
7-8 in order for the MBTA 
to perform work at JFK/
UMass station.

• The MBTA has been 
working closely with the 
City of Boston and the de-
veloper in order to accom-
modate the private Gov-
ernment Center Garage 
work affecting both the 
Orange and Green Lines:

• Riders should note 
that Haymarket-area buses 

will not be diverted during 
these weekends and will 
continue to stop at the 
temporary Haymarket bus 
stops. A list of Haymarket 
bus routes and these tem-
porary stops is available at 
mbta.com.

• Orange and Green 
Line trains will bypass 
Haymarket station during 
the weekends of January 
7-8 and January 21-22. 
Orange Line riders should 
exit at North Station or 
State and walk to the Hay-
market area. Green Line 
riders should exit at North 
Station or Government 
Center station. These sta-

tions are less than a half-
mile from Haymarket, or 
a four- to eight-minute 
walk.

• Closures will also take 
place on the Orange Line 
between Back Bay and 
North Station and on the 
Green Line between North 
Station and Government 
Center Station during the 
weekend of January 14-
15. Orange Line riders are 
asked to use Green Line 
service between Copley 
and Government Cen-
ter stations. Green Line 
service between North 
Station and Government 
Center Station will be re-
placed with shuttle bus 
service. The purpose of 
these weekend diversions 
is to accommodate the 
private Garage demoli-
tion work. The MBTA 
will also perform mainte-
nance on track, signal, and 
power systems, including 
the replacement of rail 
between Chinatown and 
Tufts Medical Center sta-
tions.

• Extra MBTA person-
nel and Transit Ambas-
sadors will be on-hand to 

assist customers. Acces-
sibility vans will also be 
available for on-demand 
transportation – riders 
should ask MBTA person-
nel for information and 
assistance. More informa-
tion on alternate paths of 
travel will be available at 
mbta.com/alerts.

• Riders are also ad-
vised that, due to the com-
plexity of the continued 
demolition of the Gov-
ernment Center Garage 
by HYM Construction, 
additional weekend diver-
sions will be necessary in 
the coming months to ac-
commodate the ongoing 
work. The MBTA apol-
ogizes for this inconve-
nience and will announce 
additional service chang-
es in advance as they are 
confirmed and scheduled. 
Riders are encouraged to 
subscribe to T-Alerts or to 
follow the MBTA on Twit-
ter for up-to-date service 
information.

• Green Line Medford 
Branch trolleys will also 
be replaced with accessi-
ble shuttle bus service be-
tween Medford/Tufts and 

East Somerville stations 
in both directions from 
start to end of service on 
Sunday, January 8. The 
purpose of this one-day 
diversion is to perform 
emergency repair work on 
the water lines that service 
Medford/Tufts station, 
which require addition-
al insulation. Riders may 
also utilize Bus Routes 80 
and 87 for service through-
out the area on January 8.

• Red Line Ashmont 
and Braintree Branch 
trains will be replaced 
with accessible shuttle 
buses between Broadway 
and Ashmont stations and 
between Broadway and 
North Quincy stations 
during the weekend of 
January 7-8. The purpose 
of this weekend diversion 
is to perform work on the 
pedestrian bridge between 
Columbia Road and the 
lobby at JFK/UMass sta-
tion. After necessary re-
pairs are completed, the 
MBTA will reopen the pe-
destrian ramp at Columbia 
Road.

DiGregorio Family owned + operated
tom digregorio • john digregorio

head mechanic paul florio
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Upcoming weekend service changes on Orange, Green, Red Lines in January

REVERE Through the Years
10 years ago
January 2, 2013
House Speaker Bob De-

Leo won an easy re-elec-
tion to the top post as 
Speaker on Wednesday 
in the State House, and in 
comments after his elec-
tion, vowed to tackle the 
state’s fiscally-unsound 
Department of Transpor-
tation (MassDOT).  With 
Revere Mayor Dan Riz-
zo, Winthrop Council 
President Peter Gill, and 
Winthrop Town Manag-
er James McKenna in the 
audience, DeLeo thanked 
the voters of his district, 
the elected officials and 
the members of the House.

The Dennis Rich Me-
morial Polar Plunge had 
its 4th annual dip on 
New Year’s Day in hon-
or of Jimmy Rich, who 
passed away from cancer. 
He left in addition to his 
many friends, his wife and 
three children. The group 
gathered en masse at the 
Beachmont VFW Post 
6712 where they enjoyed 
refreshments both before 
and after the plunge.

Mayor Dan Rizzo will 
recap his initial year in of-
fice during his first State 
of the City Address on 
Jan. 7th to the City Coun-
cil in the City Council 
Chambers, focusing spe-
cifically on campaign ini-
tiatives that he has begun 
implementing over the 
past year.

Revere’s Congressman 
Ed Markey (D-Malden) 
has officially tossed his hat 
in the ring as a candidate 
for Sen. John Kerry’s po-
tentially vacant seat  Since 
announcing, Markey has 
received the blessing of 
Sen. Kerry, who has been 
named to the Secretary of 
State post by Pres. Barack 
Obama, and of the late 

Sen. Ted Kennedy’s wid-
ow, Vicki Kennedy.

The number of official-
ly homeless students in 
the city’s school district 
has more than doubled 
over the last two years, 
and school officials said it 
is both a sobering and ex-
pensive turn of events. As 
of the end of the last term 
(December 21st), the 
schools reported that there 
is an all-time high of 78 
homeless students in the 
district – that is compared 
to just 30 homeless stu-
dents through the entire 
year during the 2009-2010 
school year.  “That’s the 
most homeless kids we’ve 
ever had,” said Superin-
tendent Paul Dakin. 

Django Unchained, 
Les Miserables, and Jack 
Reacher  are playing at 
the Revere Showcae Cin-
emas.

20 years ago
January 8, 2003
It was a busy holi-

day week for thieves and 
burglars, highlighted by 
a break-in through the 
roof to get into the Flow-
er Power and Mail De-
pot stores; a break into 
Vin's Auto Service where 
thieves smashed an ATM 
and broke open a safe; a 
robber who put a gun to 
the  head of the owner of 
Convenient Market; and 
another robbery in which 
two men, who had stolen 
a local resident's motor 
vehicle to use in the heist, 
held up the 75 year-old 
bartender of the Esquire 
Club at gunpoint early 
Sunday morning.

State Senator Robert 
Travaglini, who represents 
a part of Revere, was 
sworn-in as the first 

Italian-American Presi-
dent of the Massachusetts 

Senate. Travaglini was 
elected president by the 
unanimous vote of his col-
leagues. Travaglini urged 
the Senate to find com-
passionate solutions to the 
state's fiscal problems.

The City Council unan-
imously re-elected John 
Jordan to the post of 
Council President. Mark 
Casella was re-elected the 
vice president.

The School Commit-
tee has authorized defi-
cit spending to pay for 
the $445,000 clean up of 
the oil spill from a leaky 
oil tank and pipe at the 
Beachmont School.

About Schmidt, Catch 
Me If You Can, and The 
Lord of the Rings: The 
Two Towers are playing 
at the Revere Showcase 
Cinemas.

30 years ago
January 6, 1993
The City Council has 

elected Ward 3 Councillor 

Arthur Guinasso as pres-
ident and Linda Santos 
Rosa as vice president.

Curbside recycling, 
which has been mandated 
by the state, got underway 
in Revere this week.

In response to concerns 
raised by the City Council 
about laid-off police and 
firefighters, Mayor Rob-
ert Haas said that the city 
budget's uncertain future 
precludes the rehiring of 
any of the city employees 
who were laid off last fall.

After a hearing held by 
Police Capt. Roy Colan-
nino and Animal Control 
Officer Mary Reed, a Ger-
man Shepherd, which had 
not been licensed since 
1988, has been ordered 
euthanized for killing a 
neighbor's dog on Elm-
wood St.

George Bonfiglio, the 
founder of the 27th Lanc-
ers Drum and Bugle Corps 
that suspended operation 
in 1986 because of a lack 

of funding, is attempting 
to reorganize the Lancers 
as a   musical and social 
organization.

Scent of a Woman, Hof-
fa, and Chaplin are play-
ing at the Revere Show-
case Cinemas.

40 years ago
January 5, 1983
Ward 3 Councillor 

Catherine Penn is the 
new President of the City 
Council. Anthony Rizzo is 
the new Chairman of the 
School Committee.

Fourteen Revere police 
testified at the hearing be-
fore the Revere License 
Commission to oppose 
the renewal of the licenses 
for the Sandbar and Light-
house clubs being sought 
by owner William Dolan. 
The officers spoke of the 
history of violence and 
other illegal behavior at 
the two bars.

Operation Roadwatch 
is being credited with the 

increase in drunk driving 
arrests in the city in 1982. 
There were 291 such ar-
rests in 1982, up from131 
in 1981.

Ledo F. Lospennato, 
who has taught in the Re-
vere school system for 35 
years, has announced his 
retirement.

Two local residents, 
Joseph J. DeStefano and 
Mark J. Furia, are mem-
bers of the Class of 1987 
of the newly formed Col-
lege of Computer Scienc-
es at Northeastern Univ.

Dark Crystal, Best 
Friends, and ET the Ex-
traterrestrial are playing 
at the Revere Showcase 
Cinemas.

50 years ago
January 4, 1973
A three hour meeting 

between city officials and 
the contractor for the new 
Revere High School, the 
Blount-Fontaine Co., de-
generated into chaos after 
a 47-item list submitted by 
City Councillor Anthony 
Yantosca alleging various 
construction irregulari-
ties was not resolved. The 
contractor suggested that 
the two sides hire a medi-
ator to address the issues.

Ward 1 Councillor Jo-
seph J. O'Brien Jr. is the 
new President of the City 
Council.

Francis F.X. Hurley of 
72 Savage St., the parent 
of two pre-school chil-
dren, has urged the School 
Committee to implement 
a kindergarten program 
beginning this September 
rather than seek a one year 
waiver from the State De-
partment of Education.

RHS Principal Dr. John 
Losco has told the School 
Committee that he oppos-
es a request by Revere 

See YEARS Page 16

DO YOU REMEMBER? Shown in 1992, First Graders Deonna Hugeby (left) and Ashley Salie 
(middle) are all smiles as they listen to storyteller Tony Toledo at the Paul Revere School.
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The following inci-
dent reports are among 
the calls to which the Re-
vere Police Department 
responded on the listed 
dates. The log is a public 
record and available for 
review. All persons who 
are arrested or charged 
with a crime are presumed 
innocent until proven 
guilty in a court of law.

FRIDAY, DEC.  9
0020: A tow compa-

ny reported the trespass 
tow of a motor vehicle 
from Lantern Rd.

0543: Unwanted per-
son on Beach St. The offi-
cer restored the peace.
0820: An officer pro-

vided assistance to a citi-
zen on Foster St.
0837: An officer 

stopped a motor vehi-
cle  on Squire Rd. for a 
civil moving infraction 
and gave a verbal warning 
to the operator.
0907:  An officer 

stopped a motor vehi-
cle on Harris St. for a civ-
il moving infraction and 
gave a verbal warning to 
the operator.
0914: An officer pro-

vided assistance to a citi-
zen on the Revere Beach 
Parkway.

0926: Disturbance on 
Revere Beach Blvd. The 
officer issued a summons 
for a court hearing to a 71 
year-old Revere woman 
for the criminal offense of 
assault & battery.

0928: Motor vehicle 
accident at Brown Circle. 
The officer assisted the 
parties with the exchange 
of papers.
1121: An officer pro-

vided assistance to a citi-
zen on the Revere Beach 
Parkway.

1318: Larceny on Wal-
nut Ave. The officer filed a 
report.
1323: An officer pro-

vided assistance to a citi-
zen on Fenley St.
1334: An officer  pro-

vided assistance to anoth-
er agency on Garfield Ave. 
and filed a report.

1401: A person came 
into the station to turn in 
a weapon.

1419: Disabled motor 
vehicle at Brown Circle. 
The officer provided as-
sistance.
1431:  An officer pro-

vided assistance to a citi-
zen on Gage Ave.

1435: Lost/found prop-
erty on the Revere Beach 
Parkway. The officer pro-
vided assistance.

1449:  Motor vehicle 
accident on Bennington 
St. The officer assisted the 
parties with the exchange 
of papers.
1516: An officer pro-

vided assistance to anoth-
er agency on Rand St.

1524: Assault on 
Cooledge St. The officer 
filed a report.

1526: Motor vehicle 
accident on Broadway. 
The officer provided as-

sistance.
1528: Disturbance on 

Garfield Ave. The officer 
provided assistance.
1531:  An officer 

stopped a motor vehi-
cle  on the Revere Beach 
Parkway for a civil mov-
ing infraction and gave a 
verbal warning to the op-
erator. 

1706: Motor vehicle ac-
cident on Squire Rd. The 
officer will file a report.

1740: Lost/found ani-
mal on the Revere Beach 
Parkway. The officer pro-
vided assistance.

1900: Blocked drive-
way on Sumner St. The 
motor vehicle was towed.

1924: Larceny on Char-
ger St. The officer filed a 
report.

1945: Motor vehicle 
accident at No. Shore Rd. 
and Revere St. The officer 
provided assistance.

1949: A tow company 
reported the trespass tow 
of a motor vehicle from 
Broadway.
2123: An officer pro-

vided assistance to a cit-
izen on Wave Ave. and 
filed a report.

2127:  Motor vehicle 
accident on Broadway. 
The officer provided as-
sistance.
2146:  An officer 

stopped a motor vehi-
cle  on VFW Parkway for 
a civil moving infraction 
and gave a verbal warning 
to the operator.

2331: Blocked drive-
way on Temple St. The 
motor vehicle was towed.

2340: Disturbance on 
Beach St. The officer re-
stored the peace.

SATURDAY, DEC.  10
0009: Unwanted per-

son on Beach St. The offi-
cer restored the peace.
0114: An officer pro-

vided assistance to anoth-
er agency on Vane St.

0137: Disturbance on 
Squire Rd. The officer 
provided assistance.

0149: A repossession 
company reported the 
repo of a motor vehicle 
from McCoba St.

0209: Unwanted person 
on Beach St. The officer 
restored the peace.

0230: Noise disturbance 
on Elmwood St. The offi-
cer restored the peace.
0311: An officer pro-

vided assistance to a citi-
zen on Ocean Ave.

0350:  Noise distur-
bance on Ocean Ave. The 
officer restored the peace. 

0505: Unwanted person 
on Squire Rd. The officer 
restored the peace.

0624: Motor vehicle ac-
cident on Broadway. The 
officer will file a report.

0702: Threats on Re-
vere Beach Blvd. The of-
ficer filed a report.
0811:  An officer pro-

vided assistance to a citi-
zen on Gage Ave.

0855: Disturbance on 
Dolphin Ave. The officer 
provided assistance.

0917: Parking com-
plaint on VFW Parkway. 
The officer issued a park-
ing ticket.

0929: Motor vehicle 
accident on the Revere 
Beach Parkway. The offi-
cer filed a report.
1157: An officer kept 

the peace on VFW Park-
way.

1233: A motor vehicle 
that had been reported as 
stolen was recovered on 
Squire Rd.

1246: Suspicious activ-
ity on Winthrop Ave. The 
officer provided assis-
tance.

1354: Shoplifting  on 
VFW Parkway. The offi-
cer filed a report.

1354: Illegal dumping 
was reported on Salem St.
1405: An officer 

stopped a motor vehicle at 
Everard and Bennington 
Sts. for a civil moving in-
fraction and issued a cita-
tion to the operator.
1408:  An officer 

stopped a motor vehicle 
on Broadway for a civ-
il moving infraction and 
gave a verbal warning to 
the operator.
1442:  An officer 

stopped a motor vehicle 
on  Campbell Ave. for a 
civil moving infraction 
and gave a verbal warning 
to the operator.
1447:  An officer 

stopped a motor vehicle 
on Broadway for a civil 
moving infraction and is-
sued a citation to the op-
erator.
1505: An officer pro-

vided assistance to a citi-
zen on Charger St.
1507:    An officer 

stopped a motor vehicle 
on  Winthrop Ave. for a 
civil moving infraction 
and issued a citation to the 
operator.
1523:  An officer 

stopped a motor vehicle 
on Broadway for a civil 
moving infraction and is-
sued a citation to the op-
erator.

1528: A tow company 
reported the trespass tow 
of a motor vehicle from 
Overlook Ridge Dr.
1545: An officer pro-

vided assistance to a citi-
zen on the Revere Beach 
Parkway.
1546:  An officer 

stopped a motor vehicle 
on Broadway for a civil 
moving infraction and is-
sued a citation to the op-
erator.
1612:  An officer 

stopped a motor vehicle 
on Larkin St. for a civil 
moving infraction and is-
sued a citation to the op-
erator.
1630:  An officer 

stopped a motor vehicle 
on Broadway for a civ-
il moving infraction and 
gave a verbal warning to 
the operator.
1640:  An officer 

stopped a motor vehi-
cle on American Legion 
Highway for a civil mov-
ing infraction and issued a 
citation to the operator.

1701:  An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle 
on Broadway for a civil 
moving infraction and is-
sued a citation to the op-
erator.

1708: Threats to kill on 
Lee Burbank Highway. 
The officer filed a report.
1718:  An officer 

stopped a motor vehicle 
on Broadway for a civil 
moving infraction and is-
sued a citation to the op-
erator.
1800:  An officer 

stopped a motor vehicle 
on Suffolk Downs Rd. for 
a civil moving infraction 
and issued a citation to the 
operator.

1822: Vandalism on 
Squire Rd. The officer 
filed a report.
1900: An officer pro-

vided assistance to an-
other agency on Revere 
Beach Blvd.

1905: Noise distur-
bance on Overlook Ridge 
Terr. The officer provided 
assistance.
2022: An officer 

stopped a motor vehicle 
on the Missing Link NB 
and issued a citation to 
the operator, a 24 year-old 
Revere man, for the crim-
inal offense of operating 
a motor vehicle  with a 
suspended license (subse-
quent offense).
2049: An officer pro-

vided assistance to anoth-
er agency on Route 1.

2056: Motor vehicle 
accident on Lynn Marsh 
Rd. The officer issued a 
citation to a 38 year-old 
Lynn man for the criminal 
offense of  unlicensed  op-
eration of a motor vehicle.

2121: Disturbance on 
No. Shore Rd. The officer 
restored the peace.
2147:  An officer 

stopped a motor vehicle 
on Lynn St. for a civil 
moving infraction and is-
sued a citation to the op-
erator.
2201:  An officer 

stopped a motor vehicle 
at Squire Rd. and Lynn St. 
for a civil moving infrac-
tion and issued a citation 
to the operator.

2201: Unwanted person 
on Atlantic Ave. The offi-
cer provided assistance.
2213:  An officer 

stopped a motor vehicle 
at Squire Rd. and Lynn St. 
for a civil moving infrac-
tion and issued a citation 
to the operator.
2224:  An officer 

stopped a motor vehicle 
on Squire Rd. for a civil 
moving infraction and is-
sued a citation to the op-
erator.
2234:  An officer 

stopped a motor vehicle 
on Squire Rd. for a civil 
moving infraction and is-
sued a citation to the op-

erator.
2241: Suspicious activ-

ity on Oakwood Ave. The 
officer filed a report.

2307: Hit-and-run mo-
tor vehicle (MV) with in-
juries on Squire Rd. The 
MV was towed.

2312: Vandalism on 
Pearl Ave. The officer pro-
vided assistance.

2324: A tow company 
reported the trespass tow 
of a motor vehicle from 
Overlook Ridge Drive.

2325:   A tow company 
reported the trespass tow 
of a motor vehicle from 
Overlook Ridge Drive.

SUNDAY, DEC.  11
0008: Suspicious activ-

ity on Lee Burbank High-
way. The officer filed a 
report.

0031: Noise distur-
bance on Pratt St. The of-
ficer restored the peace.

0041: Disturbance on 
Squire Rd. The officer 
filed a report.
0044:  An officer 

stopped a motor vehicle 
on the Revere Beach Park-
way for a civil moving in-
fraction and gave a verbal 
warning to the operator.

0044: Noise disturbance 
on Sigourney St. The offi-
cer restored the peace.

0100: Parking com-
plaint on No. Shore Rd. 
The motor vehicle was 
towed.

0120:  Noise distur-
bance on Overlook Ridge 
Drive. The officer restored 
the peace.
0138:  An officer 

stopped a motor vehicle 
on Squire Rd for a civ-
il moving infraction and 
gave a verbal warning to 
the operator.

0138: Disturbance on 
No. Shore Rd. Officers 
arrested Jose Cristian 
Quispe, 37, of Worcester, 
for the criminal  offenses 
of assault  & battery and 
resisting arrest.

0202: Disturbance on 
Beach St. The officer pro-
vided assistance.

0230: Unwanted person 
on Beach St. The officer 
provided assistance.

0320: Motor vehicle ac-
cident on Geneva St. The 
officer assisted the parties 
with the exchange of pa-
pers.

0401: Assault & bat-
tery on the Revere Beach 
Parkway. The officer filed 
a report.

0459: Blocked drive-
way on Thornton St. The 
motor vehicle was towed.

0752:  A tow company 
reported the trespass tow 
of a motor vehicle from 
Overlook Ridge Drive.
0956:  An officer 

stopped a motor vehicle 
on Lantern Rd. for a civ-
il moving infraction and 

gave a verbal warning to 
the operator.

1154: Motor vehicle ac-
cident on Squire Rd. The 
officer assisted the parties 
with the exchange of pa-
pers.
1208: An officer pro-

vided assistance  to a citi-
zen on the Revere Beach 
Parkway.

1529: Motor vehicle ac-
cident on Squire Rd. The 
officer assisted the parties 
with the exchange of pa-
pers.
1537: An officer pro-

vided assistance to a citi-
zen on Shirley Ave.

1551:  A tow company 
reported the trespass tow 
of a motor vehicle from 
Overlook Ridge Drive.

1559:  A tow company 
reported the trespass tow 
of a motor vehicle from 
Overlook Ridge Drive.

1604:  A tow company 
reported the trespass tow 
of a motor vehicle from 
Overlook Ridge Drive.

1801: Disabled motor 
vehicle (MV) at VFW 
Parkway and Beach St. 
The MV was towed.

1820: Assault on Wal-
nut Ave. The officer is-
sued  a summons for a 
court hearing to a 24 year-
old Revere man for the 
criminal offense of assault 
& battery.

1829: Motor vehicle ac-
cident on Everett St. The 
officer will file a report.

1842:  Motor vehicle 
accident on Beach St. The 
officer assisted the parties 
with the exchange of pa-
pers.

1858: A hit-and-run 
motor vehicle accident 
with property damage was 
reported on Ambrose St.

1904:  Motor vehicle 
accident at Beach St. and 
Ocean Ave. The officer as-
sisted the parties with the 
exchange of papers.

1910: Hit-and-run mo-
tor vehicle accident with 
property damage on Lynn 
Marsh Rd. The officer 
provided assistance.
1911:  An officer 

stopped a motor vehicle 
on Shirley Ave. for a civil 
moving infraction and is-
sued a citation to the op-
erator.

1924: Motor vehicle 
accident with property 
damage at Tapley Ave. 
and School St. The officer 
filed a report.

1947: Disabled  motor 
vehicle  at  No. Shore Rd. 
and Mills Ave. The officer 
provided assistance.

2106: Motor vehicle ac-
cident at Washington Ave. 
and Sherman St. The offi-
cer will file a report.

2259:  A tow company 
reported the trespass tow 
of a motor vehicle from 
Revere Beach Blvd.
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WEEKLY CRIME REPORT

Staff Report

The Baker-Polito Ad-
ministration announced 
that dozens of law enforce-
ment, criminal justice and 
victim services organiza-
tions have been awarded 
grants through the Vio-
lence Against Women Act 
(VAWA) Grant program 
including the  Suffolk 
County District Attorney’s 
Office with a grant of 
$119,919.88.

The federal funds will 
help Massachusetts agen-
cies in efforts to prevent, 
reduce and improve re-
sponses to acts of gen-
der-based, sexual and do-

mestic violence; stalking; 
and human trafficking.  
The 44 grant recipients 
were selected through a 
competitive application 
process administered by 
the Office of Grants and 
Research (OGR), a state 
agency that is part of the 
Executive Office of Pub-
lic Safety and Security 
(EOPSS).  Each organiza-
tion funded in FY23 will 
be eligible for additional 
funding during the three 
following years.

“These grants allow 
our Commonwealth to 
enhance our work com-
batting domestic vio-
lence and sexual offenses.  

Meeting the needs of sur-
vivors, providing safety 
nets for those seeking to 
escape, and holding per-
petrators accountable re-
quires a coalition of law 
enforcement and service 
providers.   VAWA funds 
have allowed us to build 
these vital partnerships 
and provide resources, not 
just in 2023, but for years 
to come,” said Governor 
Charlie Baker.
“Since taking office, this 

administration has shown 
an unparalleled dedication 
to ending domestic and 
sexual violence.  As chair 
of the Governor’s Council 
to Address Sexual Assault 

and Domestic Violence, 
I’ve had the privilege 
of working with profes-
sionals and organizations 
across the Commonwealth 
that are committed to this 
mission.  This funding will 
allow state agencies, po-
lice and service providers 
the resources they need to 
effectively respond to and 
reduce these offenses,” 
said Lt. Governor Karyn 
Polito.

“These grants help im-
prove how law enforce-
ment and the criminal 
justice system respond to 
violence against women 
through training oppor-
tunities and enhanced ca-

pacity to investigate and 
prosecute these offens-
es.   It also ensures that 
the victims of domestic 
and intimate partner vio-
lence, sexual assault and 
exploitation, and stalking 
have access to the services 
they deserve,” said Public 
Safety and Security Secre-
tary Terrence Reidy.

“The VAWA Grant Pro-
gram is one of the most 
impactful programs ad-
ministered by the Office 
of Grants and Research.  
These funds help ensure 
that victims have access 
to the protections of law 
enforcement and the crim-
inal justice system, as well 

as trauma-informed and 
culturally-competent ser-
vices. We look forward to 
working alongside all our 
funded partners to achieve 
this mission,” said OGR 
Executive Director Kevin 
Stanton. 

The VAWA Grant Pro-
gram is funded by the 
Department of Justice.  
Through an application 
review process, recipients 
were selected from across 
four categories: Courts, 
Law Enforcement, Pros-
ecution, Victim Services, 
and Discretionary.  

Nearly $2.74 million awarded to combat violence against women
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LEGAL NOTICES
LEGAL NOTICE

NOTICE OF
ANNUAL/MONTHLY
BOARD MEETING

Notice is hereby given in 
accordance with Section 
23A of Chapter 38 of 
the General Laws, that 
a meeting of the Revere 
Housing Authority will 
be held at 6:30 p.m. on 
Wednesday, January 11, 
2023 at 70 Cooledge 
Street, Revere, Massa-
chusetts.
REVERE HOUSING
AUTHORITY
By:
Dean Harris
Executive Director

1/4/23
R

LEGAL NOTICE
COMMONWEALTH 

OF MASSACHUSETTS
THE TRIAL COURT

PROBATE AND
FAMILY COURT
Suffolk Probate

And Family Court
24 New Chardon St.
Boston, MA 02114
(617)788-8300

CITATION ON 
PETITION FOR

FORMAL
ADJUDICATION

Docket No.
SU22P2797EA

Estate of:
Gennaro Donisi
Also known as:

Gino Donisi
Date of Death:
02/26/2022

To all interested persons:
A Petition for Formal 
Probate of will with 
Appointment of Personal 
Representative has 
been filed by Michael 
Riordan of Methuen, MA 
requesting that the court 
enter a formal Decree 
and Order and for such 
other relief as requested 
in the Petition.
The Petitioner requests 
that: Michael Riordan 
of Methuen, MA be 
appointed as Personal 
Representative(s) of 
said estate to serve 
Without Surety on the 
bond in unsupervised 
administration.
IMPORTANT NOTICE	
You have the right to 
obtain a copy of the Pe-
tition from the Petitioner 
or at the Court. You have 
a right to object to this 
proceeding. To do so, you 
or your attorney must 
file a written appearance 
and objection at this 
Court before: 10:00 a.m. 

on the return day of 
01/20/2023.
This is NOT a hearing 
date, but a deadline by 
which you must file a 
written appearance and 
objection if you object 
to this proceeding. If 
you fail to file a timely 
written appearance and 
objection followed by an 
affidavit of objections 
within thirty (30) days 
of the return day, action 
may be taken without 
further notice to you.
UNSUPERVISED 
ADMINISTRATION UNDER 
THE MASSACHUSETTS 
UNIFORM PROBATE CODE 
(MUPC)
A Personal Representa-
tive appointed under the 
MUPC in an unsupervised 
administration is not 
required to file an inven-
tory or annual accounts 
with the Court. Persons 
interested in the estate 
are entitled to notice 
regarding the adminis-
tration directly from the 
Personal Representative 
and may petition the 
Court in any matter 
relating to the estate, 
including the distribution 
of assets and expenses 
of administration.
WITNESS, Hon. Brian J. 
Dunn, First Justice of this 
Court.
Date: December 16, 
2022
Felix D. Arroyo
Register of Probate

1/4/23
R

LEGAL NOTICE
LEGAL NOTICE

MORTGAGEE'S SALE 
OF REAL ESTATE

By virtue of and in 
execution of the Power 
of Sale contained in 
a certain mortgage 
given by Janice L. Ross to 
Mortgage Electronic Reg-
istration Systems, Inc., as 
mortgagee, acting solely 
as a nominee for Liberty 
Home Equity Solutions, 
Inc., dated June 14, 2013 
and recorded in Suffolk 
County Registry of Deeds 
in Book 51647, Page 
1 (the “Mortgage”) of 
which mortgage PHH 
Mortgage Corporation 
is the present holder 
by Assignment from 
Mortgage Electronic 
Registration Systems, 
Inc., as mortgagee as 
nominee for Liberty 
Home Equity Solutions, 
Inc., its successors and 
assigns to PHH Mortgage 

Corporation dated 
February 7, 2022 and 
recorded at said Registry 
of Deeds in Book 67184, 
Page 123, for breach of 
conditions of said mort-
gage and for the purpose 
of foreclosing the same, 
the mortgaged premises 
located at 26 Vera Street, 
Revere, MA 02151 will be 
sold at a Public Auction 
at 10:00 AM on January 
30, 2023, at the mort-
gaged premises, more 
particularly described 
below, all and singular 
the premises described in 
said mortgage, to wit:
All that certain parcel of 
land situate in Revere, 
County of Suffolk, State 
of Massachusetts being 
known and designated 
as follows:
Lot 288 on a plan of 
house lots at Oak Island, 
Revere, dated May, 
1913, F.P. Hall, Surveyor 
recorded with Suffolk 
Deeds at the end of Book 
3743, bounded and 
described as follows:
Northeasterly by Vera 
Street, 22.01 feet; South-
easterly by Lot 289, on 
said plan, 70 feet; 
Southwesterly by Lot 
277, on said plan, 20 
feet; Northwesterly by 
Lot 287, on said plan, 
70 feet; 
containing 1470 square 
feet of land, more or 
less.
For Grantor's Title, see 
deed dated 09/01/2006 
and recorded with the 
Suffolk Registry of Deeds 
at Book 40336, Page 11.
For mortgagor’s title see 
deed recorded with the 
Suffolk County Registry 
of Deeds in Book 40336, 
Page 11.
The premises will be sold 
subject to any and all 
unpaid taxes and other 
municipal assessments 
and liens, and subject 
to prior liens or other 
enforceable encumbranc-
es of record entitled to 
precedence over this 
mortgage, and subject 
to and with the benefit 
of all easements, restric-
tions, reservations and 
conditions of record and 
subject to all tenancies 
and/or rights of parties 
in possession.
Terms of the Sale:  
Cashier's or certified 
check in the sum of 
$5,000.00 as a deposit 
must be shown at 
the time and place of 
the sale in order to 
qualify as a bidder (the 

mortgage holder and its 
designee(s) are exempt 
from this requirement); 
high bidder to sign 
written Memorandum of 
Sale upon acceptance of 
bid; balance of purchase 
price payable by certified 
check in thirty (30) days 
from the date of the sale 
at the offices of mort-
gagee's attorney, Korde 
& Associates, P.C., 900 
Chelmsford Street, Suite 
3102, Lowell, MA or such 
other time as may be 
designated by mortgag-
ee.  The description for 
the premises contained 
in said mortgage shall 
control in the event of 
a typographical error in 
this publication.
Other terms to be 
announced at the sale.
PHH Mortgage Corpo-
ration
Korde & Associates, P.C.
900 Chelmsford Street
Suite 3102
Lowell, MA 01851
(978) 256-1500
Ross, Janice L., 22-
039649

1/4/23, 1/11/23, 
1/18/23

R

LEGAL NOTICE
LEGAL NOTICE
MORTGAGEE'S 

SALE OF 
REAL ESTATE

By virtue of and in 
execution of the Power 
of Sale contained in 
a certain mortgage 
given by Julie A. Murphy 
and Thomas Murphy 
to North American 
Mortgage Company, 
dated February 6, 2001 
and recorded in Suffolk 
County Registry of Deeds 
in Book 25858, Page 
59 (the “Mortgage”) 
of which mortgage U.S. 
Bank Trust National 
Association, not in its 
individual capacity but 
solely as owner trustee 
for RCF 2 Acquisition 
Trust is the present 
holder by Assignment 
from Washington Mutual 
Bank F/K/A Washington 
Mutual Bank, FA succes-
sor by merger to North 
American Mortgage 
Company to Wells Fargo 
Bank, NA dated March 
22, 2007 and recorded 
at said Registry of Deeds 
in Book 41571, Page 57, 
and Assignment from 
Wells Fargo Bank, N.A. 
to J.P. Morgan Mortgage 
Acquisition Corp 
dated April 2, 2020 and 

recorded at said Registry 
of Deeds in Book 62782, 
Page 40, and Assign-
ment from J.P. Morgan 
Mortgage Acquisition 
Corp., to U.S. Bank Trust 
National Association, 
not in its individual 
capacity but solely as 
owner trustee for RCF 2 
Acquisition Trust dated 
December 10, 2021 and 
recorded at said Registry 
of Deeds in Book 67015, 
Page 32, for breach 
of conditions of said 
mortgage and for the 
purpose of foreclosing 
the same, the mortgaged 
premises located at 33 
Ellerton Street, Unit No. 
2, of the 33 Ellerton 
Street Condominium, 
Revere, MA 02151 will be 
sold at a Public Auction 
at 9:00 AM on January 
30, 2023, at the mort-
gaged premises, more 
particularly described 
below, all and singular 
the premises described in 
said mortgage, to wit:
The UNIT ("Unit") known 
as NUMBER TWO (#2) 
in the 33 ELLERTON 
STREET CONDOMINIUM, 
a condominium ("Con-
dominium") established 
in REVERE, MASSA-
CHUSETTS, pursuant to 
Massachusetts General 
Laws, Chapter I83A, by 
Master Deed January 18, 
2001, recorded with the 
Suffolk Registry of Deeds 
on January 22, 2001 
in Book 25793, Page 
200, as ("Master Deed") 
which Unit is shown on 
the Floor plans ("Plans") 
recorded simultaneously.
The post office address of 
the Condominium is 33 
Ellerton Street, Revere, 
Massachusetts.
The post office address 
of the Unit is 33 Ellerton 
Street, Revere, Unit #2, 
Revere, Massachusetts.
The Unit is conveyed 
together with:
An undivided interest of 
16.0% in the common 
areas and facilities 
("Common Elements") 
of the Condominium 
described in the Master 
Deed, attributable to 
the Unit.
An exclusive easement 
to use any patio, deck or 
balcony extending from 
the exterior of the Unit 
as shown on Plans.
An exclusive easement 
to use Parking Space 
NUMBER TWO (k2) 
the location of which 
is shown on the Plan 
recorded with Master 

Deed, Book 25793, Page 
200.
For title reference see 
deed recorded herewith.
For mortgagor’s title see 
deed recorded with the 
Suffolk County Registry 
of Deeds in Book 25858, 
Page 55.
The premises will be sold 
subject to any and all 
unpaid taxes and other 
municipal assessments 
and liens, and subject 
to prior liens or other 
enforceable encumbranc-
es of record entitled to 
precedence over this 
mortgage, and subject 
to and with the benefit 
of all easements, restric-
tions, reservations and 
conditions of record and 
subject to all tenancies 
and/or rights of parties 
in possession.
Terms of the Sale:  
Cashier's or certified 
check in the sum of 
$5,000.00 as a deposit 
must be shown at 
the time and place of 
the sale in order to 
qualify as a bidder (the 
mortgage holder and its 
designee(s) are exempt 
from this requirement); 
high bidder to sign 
written Memorandum of 
Sale upon acceptance of 
bid; balance of purchase 
price payable by certified 
check in thirty (30) days 
from the date of the sale 
at the offices of mort-
gagee's attorney, Korde 
& Associates, P.C., 900 
Chelmsford Street, Suite 
3102, Lowell, MA or such 
other time as may be 
designated by mortgag-
ee.  The description for 
the premises contained 
in said mortgage shall 
control in the event of 
a typographical error in 
this publication.
Other terms to be 
announced at the sale.
U.S. Bank Trust National 
Association, not in its 
individual capacity but 
solely as owner trustee 
for RCF 2 Acquisition 
Trust
Korde & Associates, P.C.
900 Chelmsford Street
Suite 3102
Lowell, MA 01851
(978) 256-1500
Murphy, Julie A. and 
Thomas Murphy, 22-
040978

1/4/23, 1/11/23, 
1/18/23

R

LEGAL NOTICE
COMMONWEALTH

OF MASSACHUSETTS
THE TRIAL COURT

PROBATE AND
FAMILY COURT

Suffolk Division
24 New Chardon St.
Boston, MA 02114
(617)788-8300

CITATION ON 
PETITION FOR

ORDER OF 
COMPLETE 

SETTLEMENT 
Docket No.

SU21P0319EA
Estate of:

Kelly Pastrana
Date of Death:
05/22/2017

A Petition for Order of 
Complete Settlement 
has been filed by Wenda 
Aquino of Revere, MA 
requesting that the court 
enter a formal Decree 
of Complete Settlement 
including the allowance 
of a final account, and 
other such relief as may 
be requested in then 
Petition. 
IMPORTANT NOTICE
You have the right to 
obtain a copy of the Pe-
tition from the Petitioner 
or at the Court. You have 
a right to object to this 
proceeding. To do so, you 
or your attorney must 
file a written appearance 
and objection at this 
Court before 10:00 a.m. 
on 01/12/2023.
This is NOT a hearing 
date, but a deadline by 
which you must file a 
written appearance and 
objection if you object to 
this proceeding. If you 
fail to file a written ap-
pearance and objection 
followed by an Affidavit 
of Objections within 
thirty (30) days of the 
return date, action may 
be taken without further 
notice to you.
WITNESS, Hon. Brian J. 
Dunn, First Justice of this 
Court.

Date: December 01, 2022
Felix D. Arroyo,
Register of Probate

1/4/23
R

LEGAL NOTICE
LEGAL NOTICE
PUBLIC NOTICE

Notice is herby given 
in accordance with the 
provisions of Section 40 
Chapter 131 of the Mas-
sachusetts General Laws 
(Wetlands Protection Act) 
that the City of Revere 
Conservation Commis-
sion will hold a Public 

Hearing, on Wednesday 
January 18, 2023 at 
7:00 PM in the City Coun-
cil Chamber of Revere 
City Hall, 281 Broadway, 
Revere, MA 02151 upon 
the application of The 
Cavallo Corporation to 
construct a single family 
dwelling with bituminous 
concrete driveway, utility 
connections, stormwater 
management system 
and incidental site work 
at Agneous Avenue (Tax 
Map 2 Block 71 Lot 5A).  
A copy of the Applicant’s 
“Notice of Intent” 
application will be 
available at the Building 
Department in the Base-
ment of the American 
Legion Building 249R 
Broadway, Revere, MA  
02151 Monday through 
Thursday 8:15 AM to 
5:00 PM
Revere Conservation 
Commission

1/4/23
R

LEGAL NOTICE

THE COMMONWEALTH
OF MASSACHUSETTS

LAND COURT
DEPARTMENT OF 
THE TRIAL COURT
Docket Number: 
22 SM 003996

ORDER OF NOTICE
To:
Cruz Santiago Barrientos; 
Francisco Barrientos; 
Erik Francisco Barrientos 
Guevara
and to all persons 
entitled to the benefit of 
the Servicemembers Civil 
Relief Act, 50 U.S.C. c. 50 
§3901 (et seq):
Lakeview Loan Servicing, 
LLC
claiming to have an 
interest in a Mortgage 
covering real property in 
Revere, numbered 323 
Vane Street, given by 
Cruz Santiago Barrientos, 
Francisco Barrientos, 
Erik Francisco Barrientos 
Guevara to Mortgage 
Electronic Registration 
Systems, Inc., as nomi-
nee for Rockland Trust 
Company, dated January 
27, 2020, and recorded 
in the Suffolk County 
Registry of Deeds in 
Book 62450, Page 162, 
and now held by the 
Plaintiff by assignment, 
has/have filed with this 
court a complaint for 
determination of De-

fendant’s/Defendants’ 
Servicemembers status.
If you now are, or 
recently have been, 
in the active military 
service of the United 
States of America, then 
you may be entitled 
to the benefits of the 
Servicemembers Civil 
Relief Act.  If you object 
to a foreclosure of the 
above-mentioned proper-
ty on that basis, then you 
or your attorney must 
file a written appearance 
and answer in this court 
at Three Pemberton 
Square, Boston, MA 
02108 on or before 
February 13, 2023, 
or you may lose the 
opportunity to challenge 
the foreclosure on the 
ground of noncompli-
ance with the Act. 
Witness, Gordon H. Piper, 
Chief Justice of this Court 
on December 28, 2022.
Attest:	
Deborah J. Patterson
Recorder
22119

1/4/23
R

LEGAL NOTICE
LEGAL NOTICE
PUBLIC NOTICE

Notice is herby given 
in accordance with the 
provisions of Section 40 
Chapter 131 of the Mas-
sachusetts General Laws 
(Wetlands Protection Act) 
that the City of Revere 
Conservation Commis-
sion will hold a Public 
Hearing, on Wednesday 
January 18, 2023 at 
7:00 PM in the City Coun-
cil Chamber of Revere 
City Hall, 281 Broadway, 
Revere, MA 02151 upon 
the application of Zepaj 
Development to construct 
a 25 unit apartment 
building with parking 
area and incidental 
site work at 344 Salem 
Street (Tax Map 33 Block 
481 Lot 8).  A copy of the 
Applicant’s “Notice of In-
tent” application will be 
available at the Building 
Department in the Base-
ment of the American 
Legion Building 249R 
Broadway, Revere, MA  
02151 Monday through 
Thursday 8:15 AM to 
5:00 PM
Revere Conservation 
Commission

1/4/23
R

Region //  CONTINUED FROM PAGE 11

the end of a study on the 
best use of the inactive rail 
line corridor along Rte. 1A 
and Chelsea Creek.

MassDOT held an online 
forum last week to discuss 
two potential alternatives 
for the corridor stretching 
from Day Square in East 
Boston to Bell Circle in Re-
vere. The first alternative is 
a shared use path for bicy-
cles and pedestrians along 
the MBTA right of way, and 
the second is a shared use 
path combined with a by-
pass road that could be used 
by authorized truck traffic.

“Back in 2019, there was 
a lease proposal that was 
before the MassDOT board 
to use an inactive rail line 
running along the Chelsea 
Creek, and based on feed-
back we received at that 
public meeting, MassDOT 
did not lease the parcels,” 
said MassDOT project 
manager Ethan Britland. 
“Instead, they initiated the 
study to look at the rail par-
cels from a transportation 
perspective for what could 
be done in the corridor.”

That study should be 
completed by the end of 
January, according to Brit-
land.

Once the study is com-
pleted, Britland said any 
further action will depend 
on the will of the commu-
nity and stakeholders to 
move forward and funding 
for the alternatives.

The two alternatives 
would both connect into 
the Mary Ellen Welch Gre-
enway at its southern end 
and travel to Bell Circle in 
Revere to the north.

The bypass road alter-
native would see the road 
end at Tomasello Way, and 
have just a shared use path 
to Bell Circle.

Brittland said the goal 
with either alternative is 
to increase safety, provide 
environmental benefits, 
and address equity issues in 
the communities it travels 
through.

While Britland said there 
are not a lot of good con-
nections for the path to con-
nect to once it gets to Bell 
Circle.

“We just wanted to try 
to bring the shared use path 
as far as possible,” he said. 
“We often build pieces in 
segments and connect later, 
and also, along the shared 
use path, we do assume 
that Suffolk Downs will be 
building out a lot of their 
infrastructure. There are 
opportunities in the future 
to potentially connect into 
whatever Suffolk Downs is 
going to do.”

Ned Codd, a consultant 
on the study, said both al-
ternatives were evaluated 
relative to the major cate-
gories of safety, connectivi-
ty, resilience, and equity.

“We also looked at the 
feasibility of the alterna-

tives relative to the cost 
and permitting challenges,” 
said Codd.

Codd said both of the 
alternatives would raise 
the level of the water’s 
edge to 16 feet above ex-
isting mean sea level to 
address 2070 projections 
for sea level rise and storm 
surge. However, he said the 
shared use-only alternative 
would create more park and 
green space.

“Relative to connectiv-
ity and vehicular access 
and mobility, the principal 
feature of alternative two is 
the provision of a two-lane 
bypass road that we have 
assumed is limited to au-
thorized vehicles only, in-
cluding heavy trucks,” said 
Codd.

That bypass road would 
provide a more reliable 
connection for some trucks 
traveling to and from Lo-
gan Airport.

“This bypass road would 
be less subject to conges-
tion and variabilities in 
travel time and would be 
more reliable and faster 
than a highway connection, 
mostly during peak periods 
in the peak-demand direc-
tion,” Codd said.

Estimates show the by-
pass road would carry 
roughly 42 to 67 trucks in 
each direction during peak 
hours. That number rep-
resents about 35 percent of 
the Rte. 1A current truck 

traffic, and about 2 percent 
of total traffic, Codd said.

The bypass alternative 
also provides potential fu-
ture access for public trans-
portation.

Both alternatives would 
improve safety, although 
Codd said the second al-
ternative would create pe-
destrian and bike conflicts 
with the traffic from trucks 
on the bypass route nearby.

When it comes to equi-
ty, Codd said the first al-
ternative would be better 
for path users since users 
would be separated from 
all truck and vehicle traf-
fic. The second alternative, 
he said, would benefit East 
Boston residents by taking 
more truck traffic off Rte. 
1A.

“Both alternatives pro-
vide better neighborhood 
connections for environ-
mental justice communi-
ties, but alternative one 
(shared use path only) 
would provide better recre-
ation and access to natural 
resources for environmen-
tal justice communities.”

The shared use path 
would have a lower capital 
cost, coming in at roughly 
$71 million, while the path 
with the bypass road would 
have a price tag about 50 
percent higher at $106 mil-
lion.

MANAGER GIVES 
YEAR’S END 
UPDATE

WINTHROP -  Town 
Manager Tony Marino 
gave his last update of 
2022 to the Town Council 
last week, hitting on sev-
eral issues he has been ac-
tively involved with over 
the past several months.

“I sent out the draft for 
the trash ordinance out for 
review, and I will have 
that for the meeting of 
January to take a look at 
and discuss,” said Marino.

Marino said an outside 
consultant hired by the 
town has begun an inven-
tory and assessment of the 
town’s capital assets in 
preparation for planning 
of a long-range capital 
plan.

“They have the building 
list, they have passed it off 
to the vendor who is going 
to be doing the assess-
ments, and they should be 
starting in January,” said 
Marino.

The town manager also 
gave an update on dealing 
with what no one wants to 
talk about, but what every-
one knows is on the way 
this time of year.

“It’s getting colder, 
and that means that snow 
is coming,” said Marino. 
“DPW Director (Steven) 
Calla and I have had many 
conversations about it, and 

we are ready for the plow 
season, even though we 
are down some staff mem-
bers with retirement and 
other reasons. We’ve got 
private contractors, and 
staff members, so while 
we feel like it will certain-
ly be a strain, we will be 
able to get through this 
winter season.”

Marino said he and Su-
perintendent of Schools 
Lisa Howard have inter-
viewed three finalists for 
the Chief Financial Offi-
cer position for the town 
and schools, and could 
be making a decision on 
filling that new position 
soon.

There have also been 
meetings with several law 
firms that responded to 
a request for proposal to 
provide legal services to 
the town, and Marino said 
there could be more infor-
mation on that front by the 
beginning of the new year.

Contract negotiations 
have also gotten under-
way for a new contract 
with the police patrol-
man and sergeant’s union 
for a contract that would 
run through 2025, Mari-
no said. He added that he 
expected there would be a 
meeting set up with the su-
perior officers union in the 
near future, as well.
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LEGAL NOTICE
COMMONWEALTH

OF MASSACHUSETTS
THE TRIAL COURT

PROBATE AND
FAMILY COURT
Suffolk Probate

And Family Court
24 New Chardon St.
Boston, MA 02114
(617)788-8300

CITATION ON
PETITION FOR

CHANGE OF NAME
Docket No.

SU22C0608CA
In the matter of:
Riaz Douglas Butt

Garcia
A Petition to Change 
Name of Adult has been 
filed by Riaz Douglas 
Butt Garcia of Revere, 
MA requesting that the 
court enter a Decree 
changing their name to:
Riaz Douglas Garcia
IMPORTANT NOTICE
Any person may appear 
for purposes of objecting 
to the petition by 
filing an appearance 
at:Suffolk Probate and 
Family Court before 
10:00 a.m. on the return 
day of 01/19/2023. This 
is NOT a hearing date, 
but a deadline by which 
you must file a written 
appearance if you object 
to this proceeding.
WITNESS, Hon. Brian J. 
Dunn, First Justice of this 
Court.
Date: December 21, 
2022

Felix D. Arroyo,
Register of Probate

1/4/23
R

LEGAL NOTICE
NOTICE OF MORTGAGEE'S 

SALE OF REAL ESTATE
Premises: 72 South 

Avenue, Revere,  
Massachusetts

By virtue and in execu-
tion of the Power of Sale 
contained in a certain 
mortgage given by Maria 
D. Delvecchio f/k/a 
Maria D. Delvecchio-Ch-
bani and Hassan Chbani 
to Mortgage Electronic 
Registration Systems, 
Inc., as nominee for 
Fremont Investment & 
Loan, said mortgage 
dated December 21, 
2006, and recorded 
in the Suffolk County 
Registry of Deeds, in 
Book 41020 at Page 
124 and now held by 
U.S. Bank Trust National 
Association, not in its 
individual capacity but 
solely as Owner Trustee 
for VRMTG Asset Trust by 
virtue of an assignment 
from NWL Company, 
LLC to U.S. Bank Trust 
National Association, 
not in its individual 
capacity but solely as 
Owner Trustee for VRMTG 
Asset Trust dated July 
30, 2021 and in Suffolk 
County Registry of 
Deeds in Book 66079, 

Page 310 , previously 
assigned Wilmington 
Savings Fund Society, 
FSB, as Owner Trustee 
of the Residential Credit 
Opportunities Trust V-C 
to NWL Company, LLC 
dated June 30, 2021 
and recorded in Suffolk 
County Registry of Deeds 
in Book 66079, Page 
307, previously assigned 
by Westvue Property 
I, LLC to Wilmington 
Savings Fund Society, 
FSB, as Owner Trustee 
of the Residential Credit 
Opportunities Trust V-C 
dated May 7, 2019 and 
recorded in Suffolk 
County Registry of Deeds 
in Book 61085, Page 
298, previously assigned 
by Westvue NPL Trust 
II to Westvue Property 
I, LLC dated October 6, 
2015 and recorded in 
Suffolk County Registry 
of Deeds in Book 55282, 
Page 347, previously 
assigned by Westvue NPL 
Trust, acting solely with 
respect to Series 2014-1 
to Westvue NPL Trust 
II dated April 1, 2015 
and recorded in Suffolk 
County Registry of Deeds 
in Book 54541, Page 
36, previously assigned 
by Greenwich Investors 
XXVI, LLC to Westvue NPL 
Trust, acting solely with 
respect to Series 2014-1 
dated January 28, 2015 
and recorded in Suffolk 
County Registry of Deeds 
in Book 54541, Page 

34, previously assigned 
by Mortgage Electronic 
Registration Systems, 
Inc., as mortgagee, as 
nominee for Fremont 
Investment & Loan, its 
successors and assigns 
to Greenwich Investors 
XXVI, LLC dated June 19, 
2012 and recorded in 
Suffolk County Registry 
of Deeds in Book 49729, 
Page 264 for breach of 
the conditions in said 
mortgage and for the 
purpose of foreclosing 
the same, will be sold 
at Public Auction on 
January 27, 2023 at 
1:00 PM Local Time upon 
the premises, subject to 
all encumbrances and 
prior liens, including 
the senior tax taking 
recorded on August 26, 
2021 in Book 66162, 
Page 68 of the Suffolk 
County Registry of 
Deeds,  all and singular 
the premises described in 
said mortgage, to wit:
The land with buildings 
thereon situated in 
Revere, being a certain 
parcel of land bounded 
and described as follows:
Being lot numbered 160 
on a plan called “Plan 
of Ocean park situated 
in the Town of Revere, 
Suffolk County, Massa-
chusetts, William W. lowe 
and Llewellyn H Bartlett, 
Trustees” George A. 
Manwaring, Surveyor, 
dated February 1, 1895 
and recorded with said 

Suffolk Deeds at end of 
Book numbered 2255.
NORTHEASTERLY  by lot 
numbered 159 on said 
plan, ninety-five feet 
(95.0’);
SOUTHEASTERLY by land 
of owners unknown, 
forty feet (40.0’) hereto
SOUTHWESTERLY  by Re-
vere Avenue, known as 
Fenley Street, ninety-five 
feet (95.0’);
NORTHWESTERLY  by 
South Avenue, forty feet 
(40.0’).

Comprising the northeast 
corner of Fenley Street 
on the easterly side 
of South Avenue, and 
containing about 3798 
square feet of land.
Deed recorded herewith. 
The description of the 
property that appears 
in the mortgage to 
be foreclosed shall 
control in the event of 
a typographical error in 
this publication.
For Mortgagors’ Title 
see deed dated, and 

recorded in Book 39389 
at Page 16 with the 
Suffolk County Registry 
of Deeds.
TERMS OF SALE: Said 
premises will be sold 
and conveyed subject to 
all liens, encumbrances, 
unpaid taxes, tax titles, 
municipal liens and 
assessments, if any, 
which take precedence 
over the said mortgage 
above described.
FIVE THOUSAND 
($5,000.00) Dollars of 

the purchase price must 
be paid by a certified 
check, bank treasurer's 
or cashier's check at the 
time and place of the 
sale by the purchaser.  
The balance of the 
purchase price shall be 
paid in cash, certified 
check, bank treasurer's 
or cashier's check within 
sixty (60) days after the 
date of sale. 
Other terms to be 
announced at the sale.
BENDETT & MCHUGH, PC

270 Farmington Avenue
Farmington, CT  06032
Attorney for U.S. Bank 
Trust National Associa-
tion, not in its individual 
capacity but solely as 
Owner Trustee for VRMTG 
Asset Trust
Present Holder of the 
Mortgage
(860) 677-2868

12/28/22, 1/4/23, 
1/11/23

R

HELP 
WANTED - PCA

HELP WANTED

EVERETT - Personal Care 
attendant needed. 5 
shifts available are: 
3-7pm. Fri-Sat-Sun, 
and 8am-2pm Sat 
& Sun . Please call 
Susan 617-389-6190                                                                 ____________

DEADLINES: For classi-
fied line ads, deadlines 
are Monday by 4 p.m. 
Call 781-485-0588

Independent Newspaper Group Weekly Classifieds Section

Charlestown    Chelsea    East Boston
Everett    Lynn    Revere    Winthrop

DELI HELP WANTED
MUST BE OVER 18 YEARS OLD
MUST BE FLEXIBLE WITH HOURS

DAYS-EVENING-WEEKENDS

BAKERY HELP WANTED
MORNING HOURS

PLEASE CALL MARC 
OR CHRIS 617-846-6880

 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
  

 
 

Global Renewable Energy Company 
MAVEL AMERICAS, INC 

 

Hiring: Accountant / Financial Manager 
Location: Beacon Hill 

Full or Part Time - Flexible Hours 
 

Contact: Olivia@mavel.com 

LEGAL NOTICES

CLEANING CONSTRUCTION HANDYMAN AND 
HOME IMPROVEMENT

FENCING

John J. Recca 
Painting

Interior/Exterior 
Commercial/Residential

Fully Insured 
Quality Work

Reasonable Rates   
Free Estimates

781-241-2454

Nick 
D’Agostino
Professional 

Painter
Cell: 

617-270-3178
Fully Insured
Free Estimates

mpressive
Plumbing & Heating

Showroom SaleS & Service

licenSed + inSured. maSter lic no 12945.

Daren
DiBartolomeo24 Hour emergency service

     331 BroaDway, 
     revere, ma 02151

781-284-9555

Z Best 
Enterprises
Expert Installation 

and Repair
• Stockade • Cedar Board 

• Chain Link Fences
• Vinyl Fences 

30 years experience
FREE ESTIMATES

Call the rest, 
then call Z Best

BOB CAPOCCIA
617-799-7660
781-284-1491

ASPHALT/PAVING

G Curb Cuts G Landscaping G Water Lines G Excavation
G Concrete Foundations G Retaining Walls G Stone Delivery

G Bobcat Service G Concrete G Seal CoatG Sewer Lines G Free Fill
BOB 781-284-6311

617-A-S-P-H-A-L-T
Family Operated

Since 1963

ASPHALT PAVING - CONSTRUCTION

R. SASSO & SONS

1 col. x 
1 inch
$60.00

CONTRACTING

HOME
REPAIR?
Call AL COY
617-539-0489

Masonry &
Chimney Pointing,

Carpentry & Odd Jobs

We Clean
& Repair
Gutters

MASONRY

MOVERS PAINTING

PLASTERING

Ronnie Z.
Leave Your  

Moving To Us
Whether It Be One Piece or More!

Call Ronnie
781-321-2499

For A Free Estimate

10% OFF FOR SENIOR CITIZENS, 
VETERANS & DISABLED

PLUMBING

Revere'Revere's s Professional Service DirectoryProfessional Service Directory

TO ADVERTISE IN OUR 
SERVICE DIRECTORY 

PLEASE
CALL 781-485-0588 

OR EMAIL DEB@
REVEREJOURNAL.COM

1 col. x  
1 inch
$60.00

For 3 Months
($5/wk)

2 col. x 2 inches
$240.00

w

CONSTRUCTION 
BY 

ANDERSON
Roofing, Siding, Windows, Carpentry
Free Estimates • Licensed & Insured

Over 30 Years in Business
Bob Anderson 781-289-9032
Do Business With The Owner & Save!

ConstruCtion 
By 

Anderson
Roofing, Siding, Windows, Carpentry
Free Estimates • Licensed & Insured

Over 25 Years in Business
Bob Anderson 781-289-9032

Estimates can be done from the exterior
following recommended social distancing

L. P.
CONTRACTING

LUIGI:
(617) 846-0142

FREE ESTIMATES
… LICENSED …

INSURED

Building & Remodeling

Kitchen ✧ Bathroom
Additions ✧ Porches

Replacement windows
Garages ✧ Decks
Siding - All Types

MASTER PLUMBER
LIC #10914 $75/HR

781-853-9108
ELEC. DRAIN CLEANING

EDWARD DILORENZO
NOT FIXED - NOT CHARGEDCALL

SNOW REMOVAL

JUNK REMOVAL

JUNK 
REMOVAL

AUGUSTA 
PLASTERING

Interior/Exterior
• Blueboard • Plastering
Jim 978-777-6611

Free Estimates
978-777-6611

mr. fix it
REPAIR MOST 

ANYTHING, DOORS, 
WINDOWS PORCHES, 

REPLACEMENT 
WINDOWS, FENCES, 

SIDING, FLOORS ETC.
SNOW PLOWING

LICENSED AND INSURED
CALL AL  

617-429-0606

handy man services

2 col. x 1 inch
$120.00

For 3 Months
($10 Per Week)

JOHN PINO
indoor & outdoor repair

617-708-2150
no job is too small

HANDYMANHANDYMAN

MORELLI MASONRY & TILE
All Types of Masonry Repair, Ceramic Tile, 

Concrete Pours, Chimneys, Stairs, Walls,  
Cutting & Pointing • Restoration Cleaning

Fully Insured • No Job Too Small
Dennis Morelli

781-632-8812

Please Recycle THIS NEWSPAPER

Spartan 
Cleaning 
ServiCe

Since 1978

COMMERCIAL  
RESIDENTIAL

CARPET AND UPHOLSTERY
CLEANING

Satisfaction Guaranteed
Call

617-593-4532
617-567-2926

Removes Dirt • Cleans • Deodorizes
Complete Office Cleaning

1 col. x 
1 inch
$60.00

1 col. x 
1 inch
$60.00

1 col. x 
1 inch
$60.00

1 col. x 
1 inch
$60.00

Tommy Feeley 781-771-4707Tommy Feeley 781-771-4707

Feeley & Daughters Clean-Up ServiceFeeley & Daughters Clean-Up Service
We remove all We remove all 
sorts of junk!sorts of junk!
Quick & Quick & 
convenient service.convenient service.

Free Free 
estimates!estimates!

SCOTTIE’S
MULTISERVICES

Clean-Outs
Demo/Removal 

Inside & Out

Residential+ Business
CALL 781-971-0119

SNOW 
PLOWING

Licensed & Insured
CALL AL

(617) 429-0606

ELECTRICIAN

M
OONEY ELECTRIC LLC

Residential & 
Commercial

Fully Licensed & Insured

KEVIN MOONEY
781-799-1862

DO YOU NEED TO RUN A LEGAL NOTICE? 
DON’T FORGET TO CHECK WITH THE COURTS TO SEE IF YOU QUALIFY FOR A FEE WAIVER
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Your YearYour Year
Your CostYour Cost

JOIN THE IN-
DEPENDENT 

2023 AD 
CAMPAIGN

Jan. — Dec. 
2023

ONE FULL 
YEAR of 
advertis-

ing for only 
$$2,0232,023

THE REVERE JOURNAL | THE EVERETT INDEPENDENT 
THE WINTHROP TRANSCRIPT | THE EAST 
BOSTON TIMES | THE CHELSEA RECORD
THE BOSTON SUN | THE CHARLESTOWN PATRIOT BRIDGE
BEACON HILL TIMES | NORTH END REGIONAL REVIEW 
JAMAICA PLAIN GAZETTE | MISSION HILL GAZETTE

Choose from any 4 Options for an insightful 
year of news, sports, and social gatherings 

from your Hometown Newspapers

2 Payments of $1,011.50
1st due Jan. 31, 2023     2nd due June 31, 2023

We accept all major Credit Cards

The Year of the Rabbit

With options to change Publications on each run

Call your Ad Rep at  
Or Reach them on Email! Tap on Your rep below to start sending an email!

Maureen DiBella | Sioux Gerow | Deb DiGregorio

per paper

4Option

5 per 
CALENDAR YEAR

3col x 10 in.
5.14” by 10” high

COLOR
— broadsheet size —

5 per 
CALENDAR YEAR

3col x 5 in.
6.0832” by 5” high

COLOR
— tab size —

1

52 WEEKS
Business Card Size

3.37” by 2” high

2

26 WEEKS
2col x 3 in.

3.37” by 3” high
COLOR

2 ADS/MONTH

1 AD/MONTH
2col x 5 in.
3.37” by 5” high

COLOR
— broadsheet size —

3.99” by 5” high
— tab size —

3Option

Option

Option

FRESH & LOCAL

What’s for Dinner?

Illustrations of the flavor wheels from the book “Salt, Fat, Acid, Heat” live on our refrigerator. We use these to spin a meal 
to the taste of Africa, Asia, Europe, North or South America.

By Penny & Ed Cherubino

If your job is meal plan-
ning and preparation, this 
is a question you’ll ask 
yourself all too often in 
the months ahead. For us, 
that question is, “What’s 
for Lunch?” since that is 
our main meal of the day. 
Even for an experienced 
home cook, coming up 
with an endless array of 
meals that are tasty, nour-
ishing, and easy to prepare 
can be daunting. 

So much so that one 
savvy entrepreneur offers 
a set of dice you can roll to 
help decide what to cook 
or order for that next meal. 
Each die has a bunch of 
options, including cook-
ing methods, proteins, 
grains/carbs, herbs, bonus 
ingredients, and vegeta-
bles for each season. 

Penny uses a similar 
approach to add cultural 
variety to our meals. She 
purchased Wendy Mac-
Naughton’s illustrations 
of the flavor wheels from 
the book “Salt, Fat, Acid, 
Heat” by Samin Nosrat. 
They conveniently live 
on our refrigerator. She 
can then choose the salt, 
fat, and acid that will spin 
what we have on hand into 
the taste of Africa, Asia, 
Europe, North America, 
or South America.

Reduce Decision Fatigue
Steve Jobs often wore 

a black top and jeans to 
eliminate one daily deci-
sion. In the world of food, 
this has resulted in themes 
like Meatless Monday, 
Taco Tuesday, Fish on Fri-
day, or Sunday Roast.

Many long-time cooks 

develop a rotation of dish-
es they can whip together 
without referring to a rec-
ipe. Some of these may be 
recipes made from left-
overs and pantry staples 
at the last moment, like 
tacos, egg dishes, quesa-
dillas, grain bowls, salads, 
soups, and sandwiches.

Intentional Leftovers 
When she has enough 

time, Penny will make a 
large batch of soup, stew, 
a casserole, or a braised 
or roasted dish that we’ll 
dine on for a few days. 
She’ll freeze some of 
these as single servings 
to feed us on busy days. 
As she cooks, she’ll also 
make extra supplies of 
cooked and spiced minced 
lamb or beef, sauces, and 
poached chicken to turn 
into a quick meal. 

We have food writer 
David Leite to thank for 
the jar of cooked onions 
and garlic that’s often in 
our refrigerator, ready to 
give us a head start on a 
meal. In his book, "The 
New Portuguese Table,” 
Leite wrote, “I find spend-
ing up to half an hour sau-
téing onions takes a chunk 
out of busy weekday eve-
nings, so I make big batch-
es of the stuff and scoop 
out what I need when I’m 
at the stove."

Stuck in a Food Rut?
In avoiding decision fa-

tigue, you may be bored 
with what you’re cook-
ing and eating. There are 
many solutions for this 
issue thanks to prepared 
food, the Internet, and our 
excellent library system.

Type “recipe for” plus 

an ingredient or two into 
a web browser, and you’ll 
find hundreds of options 
for a new dish. Pick one 
that sounds good to you. If 
you learn better by watch-
ing than by reading, do the 
same on YouTube.

If you have a cookbook 
collection, pull a favorite 
off the shelf or open one 
in your e-reader for inspi-
ration. You can also down-
load many ebook versions 
of popular cookbooks 
from your library. Or, you 
can stop by and scan the 
library shelves to choose 

something from a favorite 
author, culture, or cooking 
method.

Finally, you can have 
a few prepared meals in 
your freezer to give the 

cook a break. Or, you can 
dine out or order take-
out from restaurants that 
still need your support to 
survive the slower winter 
months. 

Do you have a ques-
tion or topic for Fresh & 
Local? Send an email to 
Penny@BostonZest.com 
with your suggestion.

High students that alco-
holic beverages be served 
at RHS functions to those 
over the age of 18 when 
the state's drinking age of-
ficially is lowered from 21 
to 18 in March.

Three residents, two 
of whom are juveniles, 
were arrested last week 
when police cleared a sit-
in demonstration at City 
Hall by some 35 residents 
who were protesting the 
closing of the city's youth 
center.

The city has received a 
check for $177,460 as its 
share of the proceeds from 
The Game, the lottery op-
erated by the Mass. Lot-
tery Commission.

Charles Bronson stars 
in The Mechanic at the 
Winthrop Cinema.

60 years ago
January 3, 1963
Congressman Torbert 

Macdonald, speaking at 
a news conference at the 
Kernwood Restaurant in 
Malden, said he recently 
has returned from a month-
long fact-finding trip to 
South Vietnam at the re-
quest of President John 
F. Kennedy. Macdonald, 
Revere's new Congress-
man pursuant to the recent 
redistricting plan in which 
Massachusetts had to give 
up a seat in Congress, re-
ported that the democratic 
forces supported by the 
U.S. government are win-
ning the war in the jungle 
against the Communists. 
He said that the tactic of 
creating fortified strate-
gic villages has stopped 
the guerillas from gain-
ing ground. He also said 
that there are 10,000 U.S. 
troops in South Vietnam 
who are training the So. 
Vietnamese Army to resist 
the guerillas. Macdonald 
said that the Commu-
nist strategy is to wear us 
down and convince us that 
So. Vietnam will become 
another Korea. However, 
Macdonald said that al-
though American advisors 
are being killed in the war, 
we will not get bogged 
down in that country as 
we did in Korea. He also 

had high words of praise 
for So. Vietnamese Presi-
dent Diem, despite the ad-
verse publicity Diem has 
received in recent days.

Revere resident Dan 
Janis has opened a new 
restaurant, the Yankee 
Beefeater Inn, on the 
Swampscott-Marblehead 
line. The restaurant fea-
tures a unique innovation, 
an open hearth kitchen, 
where patrons can watch 
their meal being pre-
pared. Janis also operates 
the Yankee Fisherman 
Restaurant in Boston.

Jerry Lewis stars in It's 
Only Money at the Revere 
Theatre. Jackie Gleason 
stars in Gigot at the Re-
vere Drive In.

70 years ago
January 7, 1953
The Revere Housing 

Authority gave all veter-
ans with families of two 
children a Christmas pres-
ent this week when he an-
nounced a rent reduction 
of two percent. Families 
with one child pay 18 
percent of their income 
in rent to the RHS, but 
families with two children 
now will pay only 16 per-
cent. Families with three 
children presently pay 14 
percent.

An early morning fire 
caused by faulty wiring 
on Christmas tree lights 
destroyed the home at 60 
Waite St. 

The city has received a 
check for $111,019 from 
the state as its share of the 
state's receipts from the 
corporate income tax and 
excise tax.

The city's youngsters 
are rushing to the Revere 
police station to register 
their bicycles pursuant to 
the city by-law. The fee 
is 25 cents and each reg-
istrant receives a plate and 
certificate similar to those 
for a motor vehicle, which 
are valid for as long as the 
bike is owned by the same 
owner. Even youngsters 
with tricycles, though not 
required to register, are 
coming to get their plate 
and license. Youngsters 
also are taught the rules of 

bicycle safety when they 
register.

The story of the origin 
of the potato chip, which 
is now sold everywhere 
in America, was told to 
members of the Revere 
Kiwanis Club by fellow 
member Arthur H. Curtis 
at this week's luncheon 
meeting. Curtis, the son-
in-law of George Sleeper, 
the proprietor of Sleeper's 
Café on Revere Beach 64 
years ago, said that patrons 
at Sleeper's Café would 
watch as kitchen staff 
sliced potatoes into thin 
slices and then browned 
them in hot fat. A succes-
sor to Sleeper, located just 
a few miles away in Lynn, 
still supplies potato chips 
to area establishments.

Stewart Granger, Deb-
orah Kerr, and James Ma-
son star in The Prisoner of 
Zenda at the Revere The-
atre.

80 years ago
January 7, 1943
Two Revere men, 

chums since childhood, 
were ordained into the 
priesthood at the Holy 
Cross Cathedral in Boston 
recently. The pair are Rev. 
James L. Sullivan and Rev. 
Edward Sweeney. Both at-
tended elementary school 
at Immaculate Concep-
tion and then went to B.C. 
High. Sullivan graduated 
from Boston College and 
Sweeney from St. Mary's 
College in Baltimore.

Two large groups of 
draftees reported for duty 
at Ft. Devens on Decem-
ber 29 and 30 to complete 
the local draft boards' quo-
tas for 1942.

Local homeowners are 
being urged to insulate 
their homes with rock 
wool insulation in order to 
reduce their home heating 
oil costs by 25 percent and 
also conserve oil for the 
war effort. The insulation 
is vermin proof, moisture 
proof, and draft proof.

Judy Garland, George 
Murphy, and Gene Kelly 
star in For Me and My Gal 
at the Revere and Boule-
vard Theatres.

Years //  CONTINUED FROM PAGE 12


